
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
08.05.2025 

1 

Collbran Board of Trustees 
Regular Meeting Agenda 

Tuesday, August 5, 2025, 6:00 PM 
Collbran Town Hall 1010 High Street 

and Via Zoom 
Join the Meeting via Zoom 

 
 

1. Call to Order and Roll Call 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 
3. Revisions or Deletions to Agenda 
4. Persons not on the agenda  

a. Please limit comments to three (3) minutes and address your comments directly to the 
Mayor.  

b. Identify yourself by name and address when making comments. 
c. Comments should be courteous, civil and constructive. 
d. Town Board will make no decision nor take action, except to direct the Town 

Manager or Town Attorney. 
5. Consent Agenda 

Items of a routine nature are placed on the consent agenda to allow the board of trustees to spend its 
time and energy on more important items on a lengthy agenda.  Any board member or any member of 
the public may request that an item be “removed” from the consent agenda and considered on the 
regular agenda. 

a. May 6, 2025 Draft Minutes 
b. May 14, 2025 Draft Minutes 
c. May 16, 2025 Draft Minutes 
d. May 20, 2025 Draft Minutes 
e. June 3 2025 Draft Minutes 
f. June 12, 2025 Draft Minutes 
g. July 1, 2025 Draft Minutes 
h. July 31, 2025 Draft Minutes 

6. Bruce Smith Update 
7. Request for Waiver of Auditorium Rental Fees for Event to be Held in September 

a. Presented by Dan Currier, Friends of the Library 
8. Public Hearing-Ordinance 2025-001 

SECOND READING - ORDINANCE 2025-001, AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, 
COLORADO ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THE 
COLORADO PLUMBING AND FUEL GAS CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, THE 
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 
NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, AND THE 
COLORADO MODEL ELECTRIC READY AND SOLAR READY CODE TO BE APPLIED THROUGHOUT 
THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 

a. Attachment A – Notice of Public Hearing 
  

https://us02web.zoom.us/j/82702699232?pwd=XgVFJeDczNzvc9JZbYETekcidTbGVr.1


_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
08.05.2025 

2 

9. Resolution No. 12, Series of 2025 
A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO, 
REGARDING CONTRACTING FOR PROFESSIONAL SESRVICE CONTRACTORS AND AUTHORIZING 
AND DIRECTING THE TERMINATION OF CONTRACTS WITH KLJ ENGINEERING 

10. Discussion Regarding Water Service/Tap Fees for Property Owned by Forrest Towns and 
Bonnie Betts 

11. Request to Consider Proclamation Concerning America 250 – Colorado 150 
a. Presented by the Plateau Valley Historical Society 

12. Broadband and Auditorium Projects Update-Karla Distel 
a. Building Permit and Inspections for Gandi CNL and Associated Tower 
b. Collbran Auditorium Special Inspections Correspondence from Lindauer-Dunn, Inc. 
c. Building Permit and Inspections for Collbran Auditorium 

13. Staff Updates 
14. Public Correspondence 

a. Thank You Note-HopeWest 2025 Spring Swing 
15. Adjournment 

 



1 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Regular Meeting  
May 6, 2025 6:00pm 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
3. Roll Call 

 
Present: Trustees Winkleblack, Bethel, Stahly, and Price, and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella; Interim Town Manager Sprang (Via Zoom) and 
Town Attorney Scarbeary (Via Zoom) 
 

4. Changes or Deletions to Agenda 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO DELETE ITEMS 6 (A), (I) AND (J) TO DISCUSS (F) (G), 
(M), (O) AND (P); SECONDED BY TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Bethel –  Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 

  Trustee Price -   Yes 
Trustee Stahly –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 

 
5. Persons not on the agenda 

Brittney Miller spoke 
Monica Etcheverry spoke 
Melanie Clark spoke 
Terry Daylrymple spoke 
Forrest Towns spoke 

 
6. Consent Agenda  

a. Staff Memo to the Board: The Importance of Consent Agendas 
b. February 04, 2025 Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes 
c. March 04, 2025 Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes 
d. March 18, 2025 Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes 
e. April 01, 2025 Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes 
f. April 09, 2025 Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes 
g. April Financial Report 



2 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

h. RESOLUTION 2025-007, A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN 
AUTHORIZING AND REMOVING BANKING SIGNATORIES 

i. RESOLUTION 2025-008, A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN COLORADO 
APPROVING THE 2025 FEE SCHEDULE FOR THE TOWN 

j. RESOLUTION 2025-009, A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN 
OF COLLBRAN, DECLARING CERTAIN EQUIPMENT AS SURPLUS PROPERTY 

k. Approval of Annual Renewal of Work-Based Learning Program Agreement between 
Collbran Job Corps and the Town of Collbran 

l. Approval of a contract between the Town of Collbran and Distel Consulting, LLC in 
a not-to-exceed amount of $530 for grant and project assistance for the auditorium 
and broadband projects 

m. Request to the State Auditor for an extension of time to file audit for year ended 
December 31, 2024 

n. Approval of Change Order # 1 with Asbestos Professionals in the amount of 
$4,591.57 for additional materials abated at the Collbran Auditorium. With 
approval of this change order, the final and revised contract amount with Asbestos 
Professionals is $458,949.37. 

o. Approval of Change Order #4 to the contract with Asset Engineering for the 
Collbran Auditorium remodel, deducting $4,591.37 from the contract sum to fund 
additional asbestos abatement costs. Upon approval of this change order, the 
revised contract amount with Asset Engineering will be $1,606,804.22. 

p. Approval of a Request for Proposal (RFP) to procure the services of a Town Attorney 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE STAHLY MOVED TO APPROVE CONSENT AGENDA ITEMS (B), (C), (D), 
(E), (H), (K), (L) AND (N); SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  No  
Trustee Price –   No 
Trustee Bethel –  No 

   Trustee Stahly –   No 
   Mayor Wilcox –   No 
MOTION FAILED 
 

 APRIL 9, 2025 MEETING MINUTES 
Trustee Price asked to fix a few items-Zentz present and was not a member; Colella 
listed twice; Trustee Winkleblack advised a vote was recorded incorrectly 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE THE APRIL 9, 2025 BOARD OF TRUSTEE 
MEETING MINUTES PENDING THE REMOVAL OF TRUSTEE ZENTZ AS PRESENT AND LISTING 
CLERK COLELLA ONLY PRESENT ONCE, AND TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACKS VOTE CORRECTED 
ON ITEM NO. 8 FROM “YES” TO A “NO”; SECONDED BY MAYOR WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Price –   Yes 



3 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

Trustee Bethel –  Yes 
Trustee Stahly –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 

 
 6.g. APRIL FINANCIAL REPORT 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE THE APRIL FINANCIAL REPORT; 
SECONDED BY TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Stahly –   Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 
Trustee Bethel –  Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

6.m. REQUEST FOR THE STATE AUDITOR FOR AN EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE AUDIT 
FOR YEAR ENEDED DECEMBER 31, 2024 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE REQUEST FOR THE STATE AUDITOR FOR 
AN EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE AUDIT FOR YEAR ENEDED DECEMBER 31, 2024; 
SECONDED BY MAYOR WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Bethel –  Yes 
Trustee Stahly –   Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

IT WAS DECIDED TO GO THROUGH CONSENT AGENDA ITEMS INDIVIDUALLY AT THE 
END OF THE MEETING-NO VOTE HELD 

 
7. Auditorium Project Update, presented by Asset Construction Management 

 
8. ORDINANCE 2025-001, AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 

ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THE COLORADO 
PLUMBING AND FUEL GAS CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, THE 
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE 
NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, AND 



4 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

THE COLORADO MODEL ELECTRIC READY AND SOLAR READY CODE TO BE APPLIED 
THROUGHOUT THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 

a. Attachment A - Building Code Draft 
 

MOTION: MAYOR WILCOX MOVED TO APPROVE ORDINANCE 2025-001, AN ORDINANCE 
OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THE COLORADO PLUMBING AND FUEL GAS CODE, THE 
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE, 
THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, THE 
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, AND THE COLORADO MODEL ELECTRIC 
READY AND SOLAR READY CODE TO BE APPLIED THROUGHOUT THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, 
COLORADO; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE PRICE 

 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes  
Trustee Stahly –  Yes 

   Trustee Price -   Yes 
   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
   Trustee Bethel   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

9. Approval of Building Permit at 3011 Orchard Avenue, presented by Kat Herbert, Contract 
Planner on behalf of the Town from our KLJ Engineering partner 

a. Attachment A - Building Permit Application 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO APPROVE THE BUILDING PERMIT AT 3011 
ORCHARD AVENUE, PRESENTED BY KAT HERBERT, CONTRACT PLANNER ON BEHALF OF 
THE TOWN FROM OUR KLJ ENGINEERING PARTNER; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 

 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Stahly –  Yes  
   Trustee Price -   Yes 

    Trustee Bethel   Yes 
    Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 

Mayor Wilcox   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 

 
10. Approval of Building Permit and Certificate of Zoning Compliance application at 3033 

Pinion St, presented by Kat Herbert 
a. Attachment A - Elevations 
b. Attachment B - Site Plan 
c. Attachment C - Building Permit and Certificate of Zoning Compliance Application 

 
APPLICATION WITHDRAWN BY APPLICANT 



5 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

 
11. Approval of an Easement Agreement at 58798 Delores Drive, presented by Kat Herbert  

a. Attachment A - Ingress/Egress Easement Agreement between the Town of Collbran 
and Forrest Towns and Bonnie Betts 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO APPROVE AN EASEMENT 
AGREEMENT AT 58798 DELORES DRIVE, PRESENTED BY KAT HERBERT-
ATTACHMENT A – INGRESS/EGRESS EASEMENT AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE TOWN 
OF COLLBRAN AND FORREST TOWNS AND BONNIE BETTS; SECONDED BY MAYOR 
WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Stahly –  Yes  
   Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 

Trustee Bethel -   Yes 
   Trustee Price -   Yes 
   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
 

MOTION PASSED 
 

12. Approval of a Domestic Water Easement Agreement between the Town of Collbran and 
Forrest C Towns and Bonnie Betts, presented by Kat Herbert 

a. Attachment A - Domestic Water Easement Agreement between the Town of 
Collbran and Forrest C Towns and Bonnie Betts 

b. Attachment B - Delores Divide Rural Land Division 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO APPROVE A DOMESTIC WATER 
EASEMENT AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN AND FORREST C 
TOWNS AND BONNIE BETTS, PRESENTED BY KAT HERBERT; ATTACHMENT A - 
DOMESTIC WATER EASEMENT AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN 
AND FORREST C TOWNS AND BONNIE BETTS AND ATTACHMENT B - DELORES 
DIVIDE RURAL LAND DIVISION; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE PRICE 
 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Bethel -   Yes  
Trustee Stahly –  Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 

   Trustee Price -   Yes 
    

MOTION PASSED 
 

13. RESOLUTION 2025-010, A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF 
COLLBRAN, APPROVING THE TRANSFER OF $9,000 FROM THE TOWN’S GENERAL FUND TO 



6 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

THE WATER AND SEWER FUND PURSUANT TO A PREVIOUSLY APPROVED EXCHANGE WITH 
KENDALL AND TERESA WILCOX FOR THE DEDICATION OF A TEN-FOOT STRIP OF LAND 
LOCATED IN THE TERRELL PARK SUBDIVISION 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION 2025-010, A 
RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, 
APPROVING THE TRANSFER OF $9,000 FROM THE TOWN’S GENERAL FUND TO THE 
WATER AND SEWER FUND PURSUANT TO A PREVIOUSLY APPROVED EXCHANGE 
WITH KENDALL AND TERESA WILCOX FOR THE DEDICATION OF A TEN-FOOT STRIP 
OF LAND LOCATED IN THE TERRELL PARK SUBDIVISION; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE 
BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
    Trustee Price -   Yes 

Trustee Bethel –  Yes 
Trustee Stahly -   Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Recused 
 

MOTION PASSED 
 

14. Street Dance Invoice Budgetary Request a supplement to Board Approved April 09, 2025 
approved Fourth of July Street Closure Request, presented by Brandi Norsby 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE THE STREET CLOSURE ON JULY 
FROM 8 – 12 PM AND SUPPLEMENT THE PRICE OF $189.45 FOR INSURANCE AND 
$1,000.00 FOR A BAND WHICH WILL BE INVOICE DIRECTLY TO THE TOWN; 
SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Stahly –  Yes 
   Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 

Trustee Stahly -   Yes 
   Trustee Price -   Yes  
   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes  

MOTION PASSED 
 

15. Street Closure Request, Heritage Days Parade on Fourth of July, presented by Brandi 
Wiltse 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE THE HERITAGE DAYS PARADE ON THE 
FOURTH OF JULY AT 9:00 AM TO 11:00 AM; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK 

mailto:brandiskitchenco@yahoo.com


7 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

    Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
Trustee Stahly -   Yes 

   Trustee Price -   Yes 
    

MOTION PASSED 
 

16. Heritage Days Presentation on Fireworks, a Ground Show, and Band, presented by 
Tamera Clark 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO APPROVE THE HERITAGE DAYS 
PRESENTATION ON FIREWORKS, A GROUND SHOW AND BAND, PRESENTED BY TAMERA 
CLARK - 1) SPECIAL EVENT PERMIT FOR BEER GARDEN AND 3) APPROVAL OF FUNDS FOR 
PURCHASE OF FIREWORKS PENDING APPROVAL OF LOCAL FIRE DEPARTMENT NOT TO 
EXCEED $5,000.00; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Price -   Yes  
   Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Stahly -   Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

17. Trustee Price’s Requested Agenda Items from the April 09, 2025, Board Meeting, 
presented by Trustee Price 

a. Discussion on surveillance cameras at Town Hall 
b. Discussion on Monthly Financial Reports, request to add additional 

information 
c. Discussion of reimbursement of PVSD Waterline Expenditures 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO TABLE AGENDA ITEM NO. 17; SECONDED BY MAYOR 
WILCOX 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Stahly -   Yes 



8 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

   Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
Trustee Price -   Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
 

MOTION PASSED 
 

18. Water Attorney Interviews 
a. Nazarenus, Stack, & Wombacher, LLC 
b. JVAM Law 
c. Lisa Voorhis 
d. Burns, FIGA & Will Attorneys 

 
19. EXECUTIVE SESSION: The Board of Trustees may enter into an executive session pursuant 

to C.R.S. 24-6-402(4)(b) for a conference with the Town Attorney for the purpose of 
receiving legal advice on specific legal questions concerning possible employment 
agreements with a Town Water Attorney. 
 

REGULAR MEETING RECESSED AT 9:17 PM FOR EXECUTIVE SESSION 
REGULAR MEETING RESUMED AT 9:33 PM 

 
Mayor Wilcox directed staff and the Town Attorney to negotiate and discuss a contract 
with Nazarenus, Stack & Wombacher 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
   Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
   Trustee Price -   Yes 

Trustee Stahly -   Yes 
 

 UNANIMOUS CONSENT 
 

20. EXECUTIVE SESSION: The Board of Trustees may enter into an executive session pursuant 
to C.R.S. 24-6-402(4)(b) for a conference with the Town Attorney for the purpose of 
receiving legal advice on specific legal questions concerning broadband and/or Optimus 
Communications. 
 

21. Town Attorney Update 
a.  30-day notice to withdraw as Town Attorney 

 
22. Staff Updates 



9 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

a. Interim Town Administrator, professional services contract expires on Friday, May 
09, 2025 

b. Incident Reports from Mesa County Sheriff for March 2025 and First Quarter 
2025 – informational only and for Trustee review 

c. KLJ Projects Update 
 
REMAINING CONSENT AGENDA ITEMS 
 

a. February 04, 2025 Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes 
 

MOTION: MAYOR WILCOX MOVED TO APPROVE FEBRUARY 04, 2025, MARCH 04, 2025, 
MARCH 18, 2025 AND APRIL 01, 2025 BOARD OF TRUSTEES MEETING MINUTES; 
SECONDED BY TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Stahly -   Yes 
Trustee Bethel –   Yes 

   Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

Trustee Price -   Yes 
 

MOTION PASSED 
 

h. RESOLUTION 2025-007, A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN 
AUTHORIZING AND REMOVING BANKING SIGNATORIES 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION 2025-007, A RESOLUTION 
OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN AUTHORIZING AND REMOVING BANKING SIGNATORIES; 
SECONDED BY TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Bethel -   Yes 
Trustee Stahly  –  Yes 

   Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
Trustee Price -   Yes 

    Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
 

MOTION PASSED 
 

k. Approval of Annual Renewal of Work-Based Learning Program Agreement between 
Collbran Job Corps and the Town of Collbran 

 



10 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO APPROVE ANNUAL RENEWAL OF WORK-
BASED LEARNING PROGRAM AGREEMENT BETWEEN COLLBRAN JOB CORPS AND THE 
TOWN OF COLLBRAN; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE PRICE 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Price -   Yes 
Trustee Bethel  –  Yes 

   Trustee Stahly–   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack-   Yes 

    Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
 

MOTION PASSED 
 

l. Approval of a contract between the Town of Collbran and Distel Consulting, LLC in 
a not-to-exceed amount of $530 for grant and project assistance for the auditorium 
and broadband projects 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO APPROVE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE 
TOWN OF COLLBRAN AND DISTEL CONSULTING, LLC IN A NOT-TO-EXCEED AMOUNT OF 
$530 FOR GRANT AND PROJECT ASSISTANCE FOR THE AUDITORIUM AND BROADBAND 
PROJECTS; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE STAHLY 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Bethel  –  No 

   Trustee Price–   No 
Mayor Wilcox –   Yes  
Trustee Stahly-   Yes 

 
MOTION PASSED 
 

n. Approval of Change Order # 1 with Asbestos Professionals in the amount of 
$4,591.57 for additional materials abated at the Collbran Auditorium. With 
approval of this change order, the final and revised contract amount with Asbestos 
Professionals is $458,949.37. 
o. Approval of Change Order #4 to the contract with Asset Engineering for the 

Collbran Auditorium remodel, deducting $4,591.37 from the contract sum to 
fund additional asbestos abatement costs. Upon approval of this change order, 
the revised contract amount with Asset Engineering will be $1,606,804.22. 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE STAHLY MOVED TO APPROVE CHANGE ORDER # 1 WITH ASBESTOS 
PROFESSIONALS IN THE AMOUNT OF $4,591.57 FOR ADDITIONAL MATERIALS ABATED AT 
THE COLLBRAN AUDITORIUM. WITH APPROVAL OF THIS CHANGE ORDER, THE FINAL AND 
REVISED CONTRACT AMOUNT WITH ASBESTOS PROFESSIONALS IS $458,949.37 AND 



11 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

APPROVAL OF CHANGE ORDER #4 TO THE CONTRACT WITH ASSET ENGINEERING FOR THE 
COLLBRAN AUDITORIUM REMODEL, DEDUCTING $4,591.37 FROM THE CONTRACT SUM 
TO FUND ADDITIONAL ASBESTOS ABATEMENT COSTS. UPON APPROVAL OF THIS CHANGE 
ORDER, THE REVISED CONTRACT AMOUNT WITH ASSET ENGINEERING WILL BE 
$1,606,804.22; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Price -   Yes 
Trustee Stahly  –  Yes 

   Trustee Bethel–   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack-   Yes 
Mayor Wilcox –   Yes  

 
MOTION PASSED 
 

p. Approval of a Request for Proposal (RFP) to procure the services of a Town Attorney 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE A REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL (RFP) TO 
PROCURE THE SERVICES OF A TOWN ATTORNEY REQUESINT THAT IT ALSO BE POSTED IN 
THE GJ SENTINEL, CML LISTSERV AND BIDNET AND ALLOWING PEOPLE TO MAIL IN A 
PHYSICAL BID AND AN EMAIL BID; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 

 
Vote Results: 
 

Trustee Price -   Yes 
Trustee Stahly –   Yes 

   Trustee Winkleblack –  No 
Trustee Bethel-   Yes 
Mayor Wilcox –   Yes  

 
MOTION PASSED 
 

23. Trustee Informational, Items for Future Agenda, Upcoming Meeting Dates TBD by Board 
and any new staff hired or to be hired by the Board 

a. Future Agenda Requests: 
i. Optimus Communications, possibly May 20, 2025 due to full 

May 6 agenda 
ii. Website Remediation Proposal for ADA Compliance, presented 

by Trish Coberly with Coberly Web Creations, possibly May 20, 
2025 due to full May 6 agenda 

iii. Discussion about Restarting the Plateau Valley Chamber of 
Commerce, presented by Taylor Kelly-Lotman with Bluebird 
Ranch & Consulting, possibly on May 20, 2025 due to full 
May 6 agenda 

 



12 | P a g e  May 6, 2025 - Regular Meeting  

24. Public Correspondence 
b. Statement read by Former Trustee Tilda Evans, at the April 09, 2025 Board 

Meeting 

 
MEETING ADJOURNED AT 11:07 PM. 

 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 



1 | P a g e  May 14, 2025 – Special Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Special Meeting  
May 14, 2025 6:00pm 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
3. Roll Call 

 
Present: Trustees Winkleblack, Bethel, Stahly, Price, and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella 
 

4. Changes or Deletions to Agenda 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO ADD DISCUSSION AND DIRECTION ON TOWN HALL 
BUSINESS HOURS; SECONDED BY MAYOR WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Bethel –  Yes 

  Trustee Stahly -   Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 

 
5. Persons not on the agenda 

None 
 

6. ADDED: Discussion and Direction on Town Hall Business Hours 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED THAT THE HOURS THAT WE REQUESTED A TEMPROARY 
STAFFING AGENCY OR JOB CORPS WOULD BE MONDAY THRU THRUSDAY 9:00 AM TO 
4:00 PM AND THESE COULD EVENTUALLY BE THE GOAL OF OUR NEW LONG TERM HOURS 
AFTER WE HAVE THE STAFF TO FULFILL THOSE HOURS; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Bethel –  Yes 

  Trustee Price -   Yes 
Trustee Stahly –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 



2 | P a g e  May 14, 2025 – Special Meeting  

 
7. Staffing Discussion 

a. Town of Collbran Status Report 
b. Administrative Assistant Job Description 
c. Finance Director Job Description 
d. Town Administrator Job Description 
e. Administrative Assistant-Temp Employee 
f. Staffing Evaluation, Advisement and Assistance 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE CONTACT BRUCE SMITH TO SEE IF HE IS 
WILLING TO COME AND HELP US RECRUIT AND TRAIN NEW STAFF; SECONDED BY MAYOR 
WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Stahly –  Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack –  No 
Trustee Price -   Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO ACCEPT MELANIE CLARK’S OFFER TO VOLUNTEER, 
AS AVAILABLE, TO ASSIST KEEPING OFFICE HOURS MORE REGULAR AND ASSISTING 
DUSTIE AS NEEDED; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Stahly –   Yes 
Trustee Bethel –  Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO CONTACT STAFFING AGENCIES THROUGHOUT THE 
VALLEY AND SEND THEM OUR ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT JOB DESCRIPTION AND JOB 
HOURS ASKING IF THEY HAVE SOMEBODY QUALIFIED TO TEMPORARILY HELP US; 
SECONDED BY TRUSTEE STAHLY 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Price –   Yes 
Trustee Stahly –  Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
Trustee Bethel -   Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 



3 | P a g e  May 14, 2025 – Special Meeting  

 
8. Consideration of Contract Appointment for Professional Services of Dustie Colella as 

Interim Town Clerk/Treasurer 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE STAHLY MOVED TO APPROVE THE 90 DAY CONTRACT WITH THE 10-
14 DAY NOTICE OF TERMINATION AMENDMENT; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE PRICE 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack –  Yes 
Trustee Price –  Yes 
Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Stahly -   Yes 

   Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO ADVERTISE FOR FULL TIME POSITION OF 
TOWN ADMINISTRATOR; NO SECOND; MOTION DIED ON THE FLOOR 
 

MEETING ADJOURNED AT 7:20 PM. 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 



1 | P a g e  May 16, 2025 – Special Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Special Meeting  
May 16, 2025 6:00pm 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
3. Roll Call 

 
Present: Trustees Winkleblack, Bethel, Stahly, Price, and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella 
 

4. Changes or Deletions to Agenda 
 

5. Persons not on the agenda 
None 

 
6. Staffing Discussion 

a. Contract with Bruce Smith for Staffing Evaluation, Advisement and General Assistance 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO CREATE A CONTRACT WITH BRUCE SMITH FOR 
STAFFING EVALUATION, ADVISEMENT AND GENERAL ASSISTANCE AND LET HIM 
NEGOTIATE WITH TOWN ATTORNEY; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE STAHLY 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  No 
Trustee Price –  Yes 

  Trustee Bethel -   Yes 
Trustee Stahly –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

MEETING ADJOURNED AT 1:31 PM. 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 



1 | P a g e  May 20, 2025 – Special Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Special Meeting  
May 20, 2025 6:00pm 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
3. Roll Call 

 
Present: Trustees Winkleblack, Bethel, Stahly, Price, and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella 
 

4. Changes or Deletions to Agenda 
 

5. Persons not on the agenda 
Mark McGowan spoke 

 
6. Approval of Resolution 11, Series of 2025 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 
APPROVING AN AGREEMENT WITH BRUCE SMITH CONSULTING INC. FOR PROFESSIONAL 
SERVICES 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION NO. 11, SERIES OF 2025, A 
RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 
APPROVING AN AGREEMENT WITH BRUCE SMITH CONSULTING INC. FOR PROFESSIONAL 
SERVICES AND STRIKE SECTION 3 FROM THE AGREEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES; 
SECONDED BY MAYOR WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  No 
Trustee Bethel –   Yes 

  Trustee Stahly -   Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

7. Discussion Regarding Town Water Rights; Article 16, Section 7-Colorado Constitution 
8. Discussion Regarding Office Procedures 

a. Door Locks 
b. CORA Requests 
c. Board Meetings 



2 | P a g e  May 20, 2025 – Special Meeting  

 
MEETING ADJOURNED AT 7:15 PM. 

 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 



1 | P a g e  June 3, 2025 – Regular Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Special Meeting  
June 3, 2025 6:00pm 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
3. Roll Call 

 
Present: Trustees Winkleblack, Bethel, Price, and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella; Consultant Smith 
 

4. Changes or Deletions to Agenda 
 

5. Persons not on the agenda 
None 

 
6. Bruce Smith Update 
7. Approval of Resolution 12, Series of 2025 

RESOLUTION NO. 12, SERIES 2025 - A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE 
TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO APPOINTING THE LAW FIRM OF NAZARENUS STACK & 
WOMBACHER AS THE TOWN’S WATER ATTORNEY 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION NO. 12, SERIES 2025 - A 
RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 
APPOINTING THE LAW FIRM OF NAZARENUS STACK & WOMBACHER AS THE TOWN’S 
WATER ATTORNEY; SECONDED BY MAYOR WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
  Trustee Bethel -   Yes 

Trustee Price –   Yes 
  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

8. Approval of Resolution 13, Series of 2025 
RESOLUTION NO. 13, SERIES 2025 - A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE 
TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO APPROVING A REPRESENTATION AGREEMENT WITH 
NAZARENUS STACK & WOMBACHER FOR WATER TOWN ATTORNEY LEGAL SERVICES 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION NO. 13, SERIES 



2 | P a g e  June 3, 2025 – Regular Meeting  

2025 - A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, 
COLORADO APPROVING A REPRESENTATION AGREEMENT WITH NAZARENUS STACK & 
WOMBACHER FOR WATER TOWN ATTORNEY LEGAL SERVICES; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE 
BETHEL  
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

9. Consideration of a Street Closure Request, Oktoberfest, presented by Tascha Vig 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE STREET CLOSURE FOR OKTOBERFEST FOR 
SEPTEMBER 12, 2025 FROM 4PM TO 9PM; SECONDED BY MAYOR WILCOX 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

10. Approval of Resolution No. 14, Series of 2025 
RESOLUTION NO. 14, SERIES OF 2025 – A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE 
TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO DECLARING THE POSITION OF TOWN ATTORNEY VACANT  
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION NO. 14, SERIES OF 2025 – A 
RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO DECLARING 
THE POSITION OF TOWN ATTORNEY VACANT; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Price –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Bethel –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

11. Approval of Building Permit and Certificate of Zoning Compliance application at 3033 Pinion St 
Presented by Kat Herbert  

a. Attachment A - Building Permit and Certificate of Zoning Compliance Application  
b. Attachment B - Site Plan 
c. Attachment C – Elevations 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE BUILDING PERMIT AND CERTIFICATE OF 



3 | P a g e  June 3, 2025 – Regular Meeting  

ZONING COMPLIANCE APPLICATION AT 3033 PINION STREET; ATTACHMENT A, 
ATTACHMENT B AND ATTACHMENT C; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE WINKLEBLACK 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Price –   Yes 
Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

12. Presentation by Laramie Energy - General Update of Current Projects and Activities 
13. Website Remediation Proposal for ADA Compliance  

Presented by Trish Coberly with Coberly Web Creations 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO CONTRACT TRISH COBERLY WITH COBERLY WEB 
CREATIONS FOR WEBSITE REMEDIATION PROPOSAL FOR ADA COMPLIANCE; SECONDED 
BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

14. Plateau Valley High School Scoreboard 
a. Exhibit A - Signed fire code plan review from the Colorado Division of Fire Prevention & Control, 

showing that a fire code review and inspections are not required 
b. Exhibit B - Scoreboard construction drawing signed by an engineer licensed in the State of 

Colorado 
c. Exhibit C - Structural engineering calculations signed by an engineer licensed in the State of 

Colorado 
d. Exhibit D - Construction specifications 
e. Exhibit E - Scoreboard product specifications 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE THE PLATEAU VALLEY HIGH SCHOOL 
SCOREBOARD CONSTRUCTION; EXHIBIT A, EXHIBIT B, EXHIBIT C, EXHIBIT D AND EXHIBIT 
E, AS PRESENTED; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
Trustee Price –   Yes 
Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 



4 | P a g e  June 3, 2025 – Regular Meeting  

15. Presentation by Mark McGowan 
Optimus Communications - Internet and Voice Services Proposal 

16. Town Attorney Update 
17. Staff Updates 
18. Trustee Informational, Items for Future Agenda, Upcoming Meeting Dates TBD by Board  

a. Future Agenda Requests: 
i. Town Attorney Interviews and Selection Process 

19. Public Correspondence 
a. Statement read by Monica Etcheverry for Rachel Showalter, at May 6, 2025, Board Meeting 
b. Letter from HopeWest regarding Spring Swing Update 

20. Adjournment 
 

MEETING ADJOURNED AT 8:09 PM. 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 



1 | P a g e  June 12, 2025 – Special Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Special Meeting  
June 12, 2025 2:00pm 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
3. Roll Call 

 
Present: Trustees Winkleblack, Bethel, Price, Stahly and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella; Consultant Smith 
 

4. Changes or Deletions to Agenda 
 

5. Persons not on the agenda 
None 

 
6. Executive Session 

The Board of Trustees may Enter into Executive Session pursuant to C.R.S. § 24-6-402(4)(f) 
for potential interviews with candidates, discussion of qualifications, and potential 
appointment of a Town Attorney 

 
REGULAR MEETING RECESSED AT 2:09 PM FOR EXECUTIVE SESSION 

REGULAR MEETING RESUMED AT 3:28 PM 
 

7. Possible motion to direct Town staff regarding appointment of Town Attorney 
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO DIRECT STAFF TO CONTACT CHRISTOPHER 
MCANANY AT THE DUFFORD WALDECK LAW FIRM TO OFFER THEM THE POSITION AS THE 
COLLBRAN TOWN ATTORNEY UNTIL THE ELECTION IN APRIL; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE 
BETHEL 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
  Trustee Price -   Yes 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
  Trustee Stahly -   Yes 
  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

8. Update-Bruce Smith 
9. Adjournment 



2 | P a g e  June 12, 2025 – Special Meeting  

 
MEETING ADJOURNED AT 3:41 PM. 

 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 



1 | P a g e  July 1, 2025 – Regular Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Regular Meeting  
July 1, 2025 6:00pm 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order (6:15 pm) 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
3. Roll Call 

 
Present: Trustees Winkleblack (via Zoom), Bethel, Price, Stahly and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella; Consultant Smith 
 

4. Changes or Deletions to Agenda 
 

5. Persons not on the agenda 
Carol Gregory spoke 

 
6. Bruce Smith Update 
7. RESOLUTION NO. 16, SERIES 2025 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE A LEGAL SERVICES AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN AND DUFFORD WALDECK, LLP 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION NO. 16, SERIES 2025; A 
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE A LEGAL SERVICES AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN AND DUFFORD WALDECK, LLP; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE 
BETHEL 
Vote Results: 
  Trustee Stahly -   Yes 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
Trustee Bethel –   Yes 

  Trustee Price -   Yes 
  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

8. RESOLUTION NO. 15, SERIES OF 2025 
A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO APPROVING AN 
UPDATED EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT FOR INTERIM TOWN CLERK/TREASURER 
 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION NO. 15, SERIES OF 2025 – A 
RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO APPROVING 
AN UPDATED EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT FOR INTERIM TOWN CLERK/TREASURER; SECONDED 



2 | P a g e  July 1, 2025 – Regular Meeting  

BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
  Trustee Stahly -   Yes 

Trustee Bethel –   Yes 
  Trustee Price -   Yes 
  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

9. Discussion Regarding Water Service/Taps for Property Owned by Forrest Towns and Bonnie Betts  
10. Discussion Regarding Delegating Authority to Administratively Approve Certain Minor Building 

Permits 
a. Memorandum from Kat Herbert 
b. RESOLUTION NO. 17, SERIES OF 2025 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, 
COLORADO DELEGATING AUTHORITY TO ADMINISTRATIVELY APPROVE CERTAIN 
MINOR BUILDING PERMITS 

 
MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE RESOLUTION NO. 17, SERIES OF 2025-A 
RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 
DELEGATING AUTHORITY TO ADMINISTRATIVELY APPROVE CERTAIN MINOR BUILDING 
PERMITS; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE STAHLY 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 
  Trustee Stahly -   Yes 

Trustee Price –   Yes 
  Trustee Bethel -   Yes 
  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

11. Updates on Broadband and Auditorium Projects – Karla Distel  
12. Staff Updates 

a. Incident Reports from Mesa County Sheriff for May 2025 – informational only and for Trustee 
review 

13. Trustee Informational, Items for Future Agenda, Upcoming Meeting Dates TBD by Board  
a. Call July 15, 2025, Special Meeting (not work session); Second Reading of International 

Codes Adoption Ordinance  
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO CALL JULY 15, 2025, SPECIAL MEETING (NOT WORK 
SESSION) FOR SECOND READING OF INTERNATIONAL CODES ADOPTION ORDINANCE AND 
FOR ANY OTHER ITEMS THAT MAY ARISE; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE STAHLY 
Vote Results: 

Trustee Bethel -   Yes 
  Trustee Winkleblack -  Yes 

Trustee Stahly–   Yes 
  Trustee Price -   Yes 



3 | P a g e  July 1, 2025 – Regular Meeting  

  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 
MOTION PASSED 
 

14. Adjournment 
 

MEETING ADJOURNED AT 8:25 PM. 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 



1 | P a g e  July 31, 2025 – Special Meeting  

Minutes 
Town of Collbran  

Board of Trustees Special Meeting  
July 31, 2025 11:00am 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
1. Call to Order and Roll Call (11:07 am) 

 
2. Pledge of Allegiance 

 
Present: Trustees Bethel, Price, Stahly and Mayor Wilcox  
 
Staff Present: Interim Town Clerk Colella; Administrative Assistant White 
 

3. Revisions or Deletions to Agenda 
 

4. Persons not on the agenda 
None 

 
5. Request to the State Auditor for an extension of time to file audit for year ended 

December 31, 2024; Authorization for Mayor to Sign  
 

MOTION: TRUSTEE PRICE MOVED TO APPROVE REQUEST TO THE STATE AUDITOR FOR AN 
EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE AUDIT FOR YEAR ENDED DECEMBER 31, 2024; AUTHORIZATION 
FOR MAYOR TO SIGN; SECONDED BY TRUSTEE BETHEL 
Vote Results: 
  Trustee Bethel -   Yes 

Trustee Stahly –   Yes 
  Trustee Price -   Yes 
  Mayor Wilcox –   Yes 

MOTION PASSED 
 

6. Adjournment 
 

MEETING ADJOURNED AT 11:10 AM. 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Approved      Attest 







1 

TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 

Ordinance 2025-01 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO ADOPTING AND 

AMENDING THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL 

PLUMBING CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, THE 

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING 

BUILDING CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, THE NATIONAL 

ELECTRICAL CODE, THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, 

AND THE COLORADO MODEL ELECTRIC READY AND SOLAR READY CODE TO 

BE APPLIED THROUGHOUT THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO. 

WHEREAS, pursuant to C.R.S. §§ 31-15-401, et seq., and 31-16-201, et seq., as amended, 

the Board of Trustees (the “Board”) for the Town of Collbran, Colorado (the “Town”) has the 

power to adopt generally applicable ordinances, including adopting by reference certain model 

codes including a building code; 

WHEREAS, the Town has previously adopted by reference various model codes 

published by the International Code Council (the “ICC”) including the 2018 International Building 

Code, the 2018 International Plumbing Code, the 2018 International Mechanical Code, the 2018 

International Fuel Gas Code, the 2018 International Existing Building Code, the 2018 International 

Residential Code, and the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code (together, the “2018 

International Model Codes”); 

WHEREAS, the Town has previously adopted by reference the 2017 National Electrical 

Code ”) (the “2017 National Electrical Code”) published by the National Fire Protection 

Association (the “NFPA”);  

WHEREAS, the 2018 International Model Codes and the 2017 National Electrical Code 

are codified in Articles 6.12 – 6.40 of the Code of the Town of Collbran (the “Town Code”); 

WHEREAS, pursuant to an intergovernmental agreement between the Town and Mesa 

County, Colorado (the “County”) – which is authorized pursuant to Article XIV, Section 18 of the 

Colorado Constitution and C.R.S. §§ 29-1-203 – Mesa County agrees to serve as the Town’s 

Building Official under all applicable model building codes; 

WHEREAS, by September 1, 2025, Mesa County will adopt and enforce the most recent 

versions of various model building codes as more fully set forth herein; 

WHEREAS, pursuant to the intergovernmental agreement between Mesa County and the 

Town, the Town must follow the County’s adoption of the various model building codes as set 

forth herein; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the ICC’s 2024 International Building Code (the “IBC”) is to 

comprehensively regulate the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, 



2 

removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, and maintenance of all 

structures; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the ICC’s 2024 International Residential Code (the “IRC”) is 

provide minimum standards for the construction, alteration, movement, repair, use and occupancy, 

location removal and demolition of one- and two-story residential dwellings and the use of certain 

equipment; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the ICC’s 2024 International Mechanical Code (the “IMC”) 

is to provide minimum requirements for, regulate, and control the design, construction, installation, 

quality of materials, location operation and maintenance, and the use of heating, ventilating, 

cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other miscellaneous heat producing appliances; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the ICC’s 2024 International Plumbing Code (the “IPC”) is to 

provide minimum standards for the safe installation and maintenance of sewage and water piping 

systems; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the ICC’s 2024 International Fuel Gas Code (the “IFGC”) is 

to provide minimum standards for safe installation of fuel gas piping systems, fuel gas utilization 

equipment, and related accessories; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the ICC’s 2024 International Existing Building Code (the 

“IEBC”) is to encourage the use and reuse of existing buildings and to provide regulations covering 

the repair, alteration, addition, and change of occupancy for existing buildings and historic 

buildings while achieving appropriate levels of safety without requiring full compliance with the 

new construction requirements of other ICC codes; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of the ICC’s 2024 International Energy Conservation Code (the 

“IECC”) is to provide minimum standards for energy efficiency, the use of natural resources, and 

the impact of energy usage on the environment; 

WHEREAS, C.R.S. § 31-15-602 requires that any municipality adopting the 2021 or more 

recent versions of the IECC also adopt the Colorado Model Electric Ready and Solar Ready Code 

(the “CMERSRC”); 

WHEREAS, the purpose of CMERSRC is to ensure that newly-constructed buildings are 

constructed in a manner where solar photovoltaic or solar thermal systems and electric vehicle 

charging infrastructure may be readily installed and building systems may be readily electrified; 

WHEREAS, the purpose of NFPA’s 2023 National Electrical Code (the “NEC”) is to 

provide the benchmark for safe electrical design, installation, and inspection to protect people and 

property from electrical hazards; 

WHEREAS, the Board hereby finds and determines that the adoption of the 2024 IBC, 

2024 IRC, the 2024 IMC, the 2024 IPC, the 2024 IFGC, the 2024 IEBC, the 2021 IECC, the 



3 

CMERSC, and the 2023 NEC (together, the “Building Codes”) is necessary to protect the public 

health, safety, and welfare of the Town; 

WHEREAS, pursuant to the requirements of C.R.S. §§ 31-16-201 et seq., on June 3rd, 2025, 

the Board conducted a properly-noticed public hearing on the adoption of the Building Codes by 

reference, including the amendments thereto more fully set forth herein; 

WHEREAS, copies of the Building Codes – as amended – are available for inspection at 

Town Hall, located at 1010 High Street, Collbran, Colorado 81624; and 

WHEREAS, to cover the administrative costs of enforcement of the Building Codes, 

including the cost to review applications and conduct inspections, the Town approves the Fee 

Schedule attached hereto as Exhibit A. 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED, by the Board of the Town of Collbran as 

follows: 

Section 1. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.12.010 – 6.12.030.  Sections 

6.12.010 – 6.12.030 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

ARTICLE 6.12 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 

6.12.010 Adopted by Reference 

(a) The International Building Code, 2024 Edition, as published by the

International Code Council, Inc., together with amendments set

forth below (hereafter “IBC” or “International Building Code”) is

hereby adopted to provide minimum standards to safeguard life and

limb, health, property, and the public welfare by regulating and

controlling various matters including without limitation the design,

construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, location, and

maintenance of all buildings and structures within the jurisdiction.

(b) The following Chapters of the Appendices of the International

Building Code, 2024 Edition, are adopted:

i. Chapter C, Group U - Agriculture Building;

ii. Chapter I, Patio Covers; and

iii. Chapter P, Sleeping Lofts.



4 

6.12.020 Amendments 

The IBC, is hereby amended as follows: 

(a) Section 101:  Section 101.4.4 Property maintenance is amended

by deletion of this section in its entirety.

(b) Section 105:  Section 105.1 Required is amended by the addition

of the sentence:  “Each separate building, structure, pool, retaining

wall, etc. shall require a separate permit.”

(c) Section 105:  Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit is amended

to read:

i. “6.  Sidewalks, driveways and platforms not more than 30

inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade, and not over any

basement or story below and are not part of an accessible

route.

ii. “11.  Swings and other playground equipment, located

outside, of all occupancies covered by this code.

(d) Section 105:  Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit is amended

by the addition of the following new items:

i. “14.  Plastic covered crop production shelters where access

to public is prohibited.”

ii. “15.  Shade fabric structures 400 square feet or less.”

iii. “16.  Storage containers on active construction sites for

short-term utilization, subject to annual review.”

(e) Section 105:  Section 105.6 Suspension or revocation is amended

by the addition of the sentence to read:  “The Building Official may

suspend or revoke a permit when a Stop Work Notice is issued in

writing by another governing federal, state or local authorities in

violation of any ordinance or regulation under their authority.”

(f) Section 109:  Section 109.2 Schedule of permit fees is amended by

the addition of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building Department

Fee Schedule.  (Copy of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building

Department Fee Schedule, is on file at Town Hall).

(g) Section 109:  Section 109.6 Refunds is amended by the addition of

the following:  “Building permit fees may be refunded at the rate of



5 

 

85% of the building permit fee provided the project for which the 

permit was issued has not commenced or inspections have not been 

conducted.  No refunds will be made after work has commenced or 

after 180 days of issuance.” 

 

(h) Section 109:  Section 109.7 Fees for agriculture buildings is 

amended by the addition of Subsection 109.7 to read:  “No fees shall 

be required for a building permit obtained for Agriculture Buildings 

defined as buildings or structures used for the sole purpose of 

providing shelter for agricultural implements, farm products, 

livestock or poultry, that is not a place of employment or open to the 

public.  This agriculture building fee exemption does not include 

fees for electrical, mechanical and plumbing permits for said 

structures.” 

 

(i) Section 110:  Section 110.7 Inspections for agriculture buildings 

is amended by addition of Subsection 110.7 to read as follows:  “No 

inspections shall be required for a building permit obtained for 

Agriculture Buildings defined as buildings or structures used for the 

sole purpose of providing shelter for agricultural implements, farm 

products, livestock or poultry, that is not a place of employment or 

open to the public.  However, this exemption is not an exception of 

the minimum building standards set forth in the International 

Building Code, or to the other requirements for inspections for 

electrical, mechanical and plumbing.” 

 

(j) Section 111:  Section 111.2 Certificate issued is amended by 

deletion of:  “or other laws that are enforced by the department” and 

replaced with: “or other codes referenced in this ordinance.” 

 

(k) Section 111:  Section 111.3 Temporary occupancy is amended by 

addition of the following:  “Such temporary occupancy shall be 

limited to the provisions of this code or any other code referenced 

in this ordinance.” 

 

(l) Section 113:  Section 113 Board of appeals is amended by deletion 

of this section in its entirety and replaced with:  “The Board of 

Appeals established under this Chapter shall serve as the Board of 

Appeals.” 

 

(m) Section 114:  Section 114.4 Violation penalties is amended by 

deletion of this section in its entirety and replaced with:  “Any 

person who violates a provision of the code or fails to comply with 

any of the requirements thereof shall be subject to the penalties 

prescribed in this Chapter.” 

 



6 

 

(n) Section 116:  Section 116.1 Unsafe Conditions is amended by 

adding a paragraph to read:  “The building official may cause the 

premises to be closed up and secure through any available public 

agency or contractor arrangement by private persons and the cost 

thereof shall be charged against the real estate upon which the 

structure is located and shall be lien upon such real estate and may 

be collected by any other legal resource.  The building official may 

condemn unsafe structures.” 

 

(o) Section 305:  Section 305.2.3 “Twelve” or fewer children in a 

dwelling unit is amended by deleting Five and replacing with 

Twelve. 

 

(p) Section 308:  Section 308.2.4 Five or fewer persons receiving 

custodial care is amended by deleting:  “provided an automatic 

sprinkler system is installed in accordance with section 903.3.1.3 or 

with Section 2904 of the International Residential Code.” 

 

(q) Section 310:  Section 310.4.1 Care facilities within a dwelling is 

amended by deleting: “provided an automatic sprinkler system is 

installed in accordance with section 903.3.1.3 or with section 2904 

of the International Residential Code.” 

 

(r) Section 310:  Section 310.6 Residential Group R-5 is amended by 

the addition of Section 310.6 to read as follows:  “Residential 

Group R-5.  Residential Group R-5 occupancy shall include 

buildings, structures or portions thereof for more than five but not 

more than 16 persons, excluding staff, who reside on a 24-hour basis 

in a supervised residential environment.  This occupancy requires 

that all persons residing within shall, without any assistance, be 

capable of responding to an emergency situation to complete 

building evacuation.  Such occupancy shall comply with the 

International Residential Code.  This group shall include, but not 

limited to, the following: 

 

Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with 16 or fewer 

occupants, for whom supervision is provided on a 24-hour basis 

within the building, structure or portion thereof” 

 

(s) Section 1004: Table 1004.5 Maximum floor area allowances per 

occupant is amended to change the maximum floor area allowance 

per occupant of Agriculture Building from:  300 Gross to 500 Gross. 

 

(t) Chapter 30: Chapter 30 Elevators and conveying systems is 

amended by the addition of four new sections and subsections to 

read as follows: 



7 

 

 

SECTION 3010  

PERMITS & CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION 

 

3010.1 Permits Required.  It shall be unlawful to install any new 

elevator, moving walk, escalator or dumbwaiter or to make 

alterations to any existing elevator, dumbwaiter or moving 

walk, as defined in ASME A17.1, without first having 

obtained a permit for such installations from the building 

official.  Permits shall not be required for maintenance or 

minor alterations. 

 

3010.2 Certificates of Inspection Required.   It shall be unlawful 

to operate any elevator, dumbwaiter, escalator or moving 

walk without a current certificate of inspection issued by an 

approved inspection agency.  Such certificates shall be 

issued upon payment of prescribed fees and a valid 

inspection report indicating that the conveyance is safe and 

that the inspection and tests have been performed in 

accordance with ASME A17.1.  Certificates shall not be 

issued when the conveyance is posted as unsafe pursuant to 

Section 3013. 

 

3010.3 Applications for Permits.  Applications for a permit to 

install shall be made on forms provided by the building 

official, and the permit shall be issued to an owner or the 

owner’s representative, upon payment of the permit fees 

specified in this section. 

 

3010.4 Applications for Certificates of Inspection.  Applications 

for an inspection and certificates of inspection shall be made 

to an approved inspection agency by the owner of an 

elevator, dumbwaiter, escalator or moving walk.  Fees for 

inspections and certificates of inspection shall be determined 

by the approved inspection agency. 

 

3010.5 Fees.  A fee for each permit shall be paid to the building 

official as prescribed in the jurisdiction Permit Fee Schedule. 

 

SECTION 3011 

DESIGN 

 

3011.1 Detailed Requirements.  For detailed design, construction 

and installation requirements see Chapter 16 and the 

appropriate requirements for ASME A17.1. 

 



8 

 

SECTION 3012 

REQUIREMENTS FOR OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE 

 

3012.1 General.  The owner shall be responsible for the safe 

operation and maintenance of each elevator, dumbwaiter, 

escalator and moving walk installations and shall cause 

periodic inspections to be made on such conveyances as 

required by this section. 

 

3012.2 Periodic Inspection and Tests.  Routine and periodic 

inspections and tests shall be made as required by ASME 

A17.1. 

 

3012.3 Alterations, Repairs and Maintenance.  Alterations, 

repairs and maintenance shall be made as required by ASME 

A17.1. 

 

3012.4 Inspection Costs.  All costs of such inspections shall be paid 

by the owner. 

 

SECTION 3013 

UNSAFE CONDITIONS 

 

3013.1 Unsafe Conditions.  When an inspection reveals an unsafe 

condition of an elevator, escalator, moving walk or 

dumbwaiter, the inspector shall immediately file with the 

owner and the building official a full and true report of 

inspection and unsafe conditions.  If the building official 

finds that the unsafe condition endangers human life, the 

building official shall cause to be placed on such 

conveyance, in a conspicuous place, a notice stating that 

such conveyance is unsafe.  The owner shall see to it that 

such notice of unsafe condition is legibly maintained where 

placed by the building official.  The building official shall 

also issue an order in writing to the owner requiring the 

repairs or alterations to be made to such conveyance that are 

necessary to render it safe and may order the operation 

thereof discontinued until the repairs or alterations are made 

or the unsafe conditions are removed.  A posted notice of 

unsafe conditions shall be removed by the building official 

when satisfied that the unsafe conditions have been 

corrected. 

 

(u) Section 3109:  Section 3109.1 General is amended by deletion and 

replaced with:  “Swimming pools, spas and hot tub barriers shall 



9 

 

comply with section 305 of the International Swimming Pool and 

Spa Code.” 

 

6.12.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the International Building Code, 2024 Edition, and the 

adopted Chapters of the Appendices thereto, together with one copy of the 

ordinance codified in this chapter, shall be kept on file in Town Hall.  

Copies of said IBC and adopted Appendices shall be available for sale to 

the public at a moderate price. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 2. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.16.010 – 6.16.030.  Sections 

6.16.010 – 6.16.030 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.16 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 

 

6.16.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The International Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition, published by the 

International Code Council and as amended and adopted by the State 

of Colorado Plumbing Board pursuant to C.R.S. §§ 12-155-101, et 

seq., together with amendments set forth below (hereafter “IPC”) 

and applicable chapters of the International Residential Code 

published by the International Code Council and as amended is 

hereby adopted to regulate the design, construction, quality of 

materials, erection, installation, alteration, location, relocation, 

replacement, addition to, use and maintenance of plumbing systems 

within the Jurisdiction. 

 

6.16.020 Amendments 

 

The IPC, is hereby amended as follows: 

 

(a) Fee schedule is amended by the addition of Exhibit A Town of 

Collbran Building Department Fee Schedule.  (Copy of Exhibit A 

Town of Collbran Building Department Fee Schedule, is on file in 

Town Hall). 

 

(b) Fee refunds is amended by the deletion of this section in its entirety 

and replaced with the following:  “Building permit fees may be 

refunded at the rate of 85% of the building permit fee provided the 

project for which the permit was issued has not commenced or 

inspections have not been conducted.  No refunds will be made after 

work has commenced or after 180 days of issuance.” 



10 

 

 

(c) Means of appeal is amended by deletion of this section in its 

entirety and replaced with the following:  “The Colorado State 

Plumbing Board serves as the Board of Appeals for the International 

Plumbing Code.” 

 

6.16.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the International Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition, 

together with one copy of the ordinance codified in this chapter, shall be 

kept on file at Town Hall.  Copies of said IPC shall be available for sale to 

the public at a moderate price. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 3. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.20.010 – 6.20.030.  Sections 

6.02.010 – 6.20.030 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.20 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 

 

6.20.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The International Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition, as published by 

the International Code Council, together with amendments set forth 

below (hereafter “IMC” or “International Mechanical Code”) is 

hereby adopted to regulate the design, construction, quality of 

materials, erection, installation, alteration, location, relocation, 

replacement, addition to, use and maintenance of mechanical 

systems within the Jurisdiction. 

 

6.20.020 Amendments 

 

The IMC is hereby amended as follows: 

 

(a) Section108:  Section 108.2 Schedule of Permit Fees is amended by 

the addition of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building Department 

Fee Schedule.  (Copy of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building 

Department Fee Schedule, is on file in Town Hall). 

 

(b) Section 108:  Section 108.6 Refunds is amended by the deletion of 

this section in its entirety and replaced with the following:  

“Building permit fees may be refunded at the rate of 85% of the 

building permit fee provided the project for which the permit was 

issued has not commenced or inspections have not been conducted.  

No refunds will be made after work has commenced or after 180 

days of issuance.” 



11 

 

 

(c) Section 112:  Section 112 Means of appeal is amended by deletion 

of this section in its entirety and replaced with the following:  “The 

Board of Appeals established in Part 13 shall serve as the Board of 

Appeals.” 

 

(d) Section 114:  Section 114.4 Violation penalties is amended by 

deletion of the section in its entirety and replaced with the following:  

“Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply 

with any of the requirements thereof shall be subject to the penalties 

as prescribed in Part 16 of this Ordinance.” 

 

6.20.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the IMC, 2024 Edition, together with one copy of the 

ordinance codified in this article, shall be kept on file in Town Hall.  Copies 

of the IMC shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 4. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.24.010 - 6.24.020.  Sections 

6.24.010 – 6.24.020 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.24 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 

 

6.24.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 edition, published by the 

International Code Council and as amended and adopted by the State of 

Colorado Plumbing Board pursuant to C.R.S. §§ 12-155-101, et seq., 

together with amendments set forth below (hereafter “IFGC”) and 

applicable chapters of the International Residential Code published by the 

International Code Council and as amended is hereby adopted to regulate 

the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, 

alteration, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use and 

maintenance of fuel gas systems within the Jurisdiction. 

 

6.24.020 Reserved 

 

6.24.030 Copies On File And Available For Sale 

 

At least one copy of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition together with 

one copy of the ordinance codified in this article, shall be kept on file at Town Hall.  

Copies of the IFGC and said chapters of the appendix shall be available for sale to 

the public at a moderate price. 

 



12 

 

* * * 

 

Section 5. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.28.010 – 6.28.040.  Sections 

6.28.010 – 6.28.040 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.28 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE 

 

6.28.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The International Existing Building Code, 2024 Edition, as published by the 

International Code Council, together with amendments set forth below 

(hereafter “IEBC” or “International Existing Building Code”) is hereby 

adopted to regulate the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, 

installation, alteration, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use 

and maintenance of existing buildings within the Jurisdiction. 

 

6.28.020 Amendments 

 

The IEBC is hereby amended as follows: 

 

(a) Section 108:  Section 108.2 Schedule of permit fees is amended by 

the addition of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building Department 

Fee Schedule.  (Copy of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building 

Department Fee Schedule, is on file at Town Hall). 

 

(b) Section 108:  Section 108.6 Refunds is amended by the deletion of 

this section in its entirety and replaced with the following:  

“Building permit fees may be refunded at the rate of 85% of the 

building permit fee provided the project for which the permit was 

issued has not commenced or inspections have not been conducted.  

No refunds will be made after work has commenced or after 180 

days of issuance.” 

 

(c) Section 112:  Section 112 Board of appeals is amended by deletion 

of this section in its entirety and replaced with the following:  “The 

Board of Appeals established in Part 13 shall serve as the Board of 

Appeals.” 

 

(d) Section 113:  Section 113.4 Violations is amended by deletion of 

this section in its entirety and replaced with the following:  “Any 

person who violates a provision of the code or fails to comply with 

any of the requirements thereof shall be subject to the penalties 

prescribed in Part 16 of this Ordinance.” 

 

(e) Section R115: Section R115 Unsafe buildings and equipment is 

amended by deletion of this section in its entirety and replaced with: 



13 

 

“As amended in section 116 of the 2024 International Building 

Code.” 

 

6.28.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the International Existing Building Code, together with 

one copy of the ordinance codified in this article, shall be kept on file at 

Town Hall.  Copies of the IEBC shall be available for sale to the public at a 

moderate price. 

 

6.28.040 Penalties 

 

(a) Any person, firm or corporation violating any provisions of the 

IEBC shall be punished by a fine of not more than $1,000.00, or by 

imprisonment of not more than one year or by both such fine and 

imprisonment.  Each separate day or any portion thereof, during 

which any violation of the IEBC occurs or continues, shall be 

deemed to constitute a separate offense and, upon conviction 

thereof, shall be punishable as herein provided.  Any municipal 

offense under the IEBC shall be deemed one of strict liability. 

 

(b) The issuing of or granting of a permit or approval of plans and 

specifications shall not be deemed or construed to be a permit for, 

or an approval of, any violation of the provisions of the IEBC.  No 

permit presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the 

provisions of the IEBC shall be valid, except insofar as the work or 

use, which it authorized, is lawful. 

 

(c) The issuance of or granting of a permit or approval of plans shall not 

prevent the administrative authority from thereafter requiring the 

correction of errors in said plans and specifications, or from 

preventing construction operations being carried on thereunder 

when in violation of the IEBC or any other ordinance, or from 

revoking any certificate of approval when issued in error. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 6. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.32.010 – 6.32.030.  Sections 

6.32.010 – 6.32.030 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.32 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE 

 

6.32.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The International Residential Code, 2024 Edition, published by the 

International Code Council, together with amendments set forth 



14 

 

below (hereafter “IRC” or “International Residential Code”) is 

hereby adopted for regulating the design, construction, quality of 

materials, erection, installation, alteration, location, repair, location, 

relocation, replacement, addition to, use and maintenance of one-

and two family dwellings and townhouses not more than three 

stories in height within the Jurisdiction. 

 

(b) The following chapters of the Appendix of the International 

Residential Code, 2024 Edition, are adopted: 

 

i. Appendix BB, Tiny Houses; 

 

ii. Appendix BF, Patio Covers; 

 

iii. Appendix BO, Existing Buildings and Structures; 

 

iv. Appendix CB, Sizing of Venting Systems Serving 

Appliances Equipped with Draft Hoods, Category I 

Appliances and Appliances Listed for Use with Type B 

Vents; and 

 

v. Appendix CC, Recommended Procedure for Safety 

Inspection of an Existing Appliance Installation. 

 

6.32.020 Amendments 

 

The IRC is hereby amended as follows: 

 

(a) Section R101:  Section R101.2 Scope is amended by moving 

Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guestrooms from 

exception to scope. 

 

(b) Section R101:  Section R101.2 Scope is amended by moving a care 

facility with five or fewer persons receiving custodial care within a 

dwelling unit from exception to scope. 

 

(c) Section R101:  Section R101.2 Scope is amended by moving a care 

facility with five or fewer persons receiving care that are within a 

dwelling unit from exception to scope. 

 

(d) Section 101:  Section 101.2 Scope is amended by the addition to 

scope:  “Child Care Facilities as permitted under HB21-1222, but 

not to exceed 12 Children.” 

 

(e) Section 101:  Section 101.2 Scope is amended by the addition to 

scope:  “Residential Group R-5, as defined in the IBC.” 



15 

 

 

(f) Section 102:  Section 102.6 Existing structures is amended by 

deletion of:  “International Property Maintenance Code.” 

 

(g) Section R104:  Section R104.2.3.1 Flood hazard areas is amended 

by the deletion of this section in its entirety and replaced with the 

following:  “No permit will be issued without review and approval 

from the local jurisdiction floodplain administrator.” 

 

(h) Section R104:  Section R104.3.1 Determination of substantially 

improved or substantially damaged existing buildings in flood 

hazard areas is amended by the deletion of this section in its 

entirety and replaced with the following:  “No permit will be issued 

without review and approval from the jurisdiction floodplain 

administrator.” 

 

(i) Section R105:  Section R105.1 Required is amended by the 

addition of the sentence:  “Each separate building, structure, pool, 

retaining wall, etc. shall require a separate permit.” 

 

(j) Section R105:  Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit is 

amended to read: 

 

i. “5.  Sidewalks, Driveways and Platforms not more than 30 

inches above the adjacent grade and not over any basement 

or story below.” 

 

ii. “7.  Temporary (removable) prefabricated swimming pools 

installed for a maximum of 180 days per year.” 

 

iii. “8.  Swings, playhouses and other playground equipment.” 

 

iv. “10.  Decks that are not more than 30 inches above grade at 

any point.” 

 

(k) Section R105:  Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit is 

amended by the addition of the following new items: 

 

i. “11.  Re-siding of buildings regulated by this code.” 

 

ii. “12.  Roof recover of buildings regulated by this code that 

do not exceed Limits of Section R908.4 and 908.4.1” 

 

iii. “13.  Plastic covered crop production shelters where access 

to the public is prohibited.” 

 



16 

 

(l) Section R106:  Section R106.1.4 Buildings in flood hazard areas 

is amended by the deletion of this section in its entirety and 

replaced with the following:  “The local jurisdiction floodplain 

administrator will be responsible for adherence to applicable 

regulations under their authority.  A final verification and approval 

from the floodplain administrator will be given prior to issuance of 

a Certificate of Occupancy.” 

 

(m) Section R106:  Section R106.3.1 Construction documents is 

amended by deletion of the second sentence of the first paragraph:  

“One set of construction documents so reviewed shall be retained 

by the Building Official.” 

 

(n) Section R106:  Section R106.5 Retention of construction 

documents is amended by deletion of this section in its entirety. 

 

(o) Section R108:  Section R108.2 Schedule of permit fees is amended 

to add Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building Department Fee 

Schedule.  (Copy of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building 

Department Fee Schedule, is on at Town Hall). 

 

(p) Section R108:  Section R108.5 Refunds is amended by the deletion 

of this section in its entirety and replaced with the following:  

“Building permit fees may be refunded at the rate of 85% of the 

building permit fee provided the project for which the permit was 

issued has not commenced or inspections have not been conducted.  

No refunds will be made after work has commenced or after 180 

days of issuance.” 

 

(q) Section R108:  Section R108.7 Fees for agriculture buildings is 

amended by the addition of Subsection R108.7 to read:  “No fees 

shall be required for a building permit obtained for Agriculture 

Buildings defined as buildings or structures used for the sole 

purpose of providing shelter for agricultural implements, farm 

products, livestock or poultry, that is not a place of employment or 

open to the public.  This agriculture building fee exemption does not 

include fees for electrical, mechanical and plumbing permits for said 

structures.”  

 

(r) Section R109:  Section R109.5 Inspections for agriculture 

buildings is amended by addition of Subsection R109.5 to read as 

follows:  “No inspections shall be required for a building permit 

obtained for Agriculture Buildings defined as buildings or structures 

used for the sole purpose of providing shelter for agricultural 

implements, farm products, livestock or poultry, that is not a place 

of employment or open to the public.  However, this exemption is 



17 

 

not an exception of the minimum building standards set forth in the 

International Building Code, or to the other requirements for 

inspections for electrical, mechanical and plumbing.”  

 

(s) Section R110:  Section R110.2 Certificate issued is amended by 

deletion of:  “or other laws that are enforced by the department” and 

replaced with:  “or other codes referenced in this ordinance.” 

 

(t) Section R110:  Section R110.3 Temporary occupancy is amended 

by addition of the following:  “Such temporary occupancy shall be 

limited to the provisions of this code or other codes referenced in 

this ordinance.” 

 

(u) Section R112:  Section R112 Board of appeals is amended by 

deletion of this section in its entirety and replaced with:  “The Board 

of Appeals established under this Chapter shall serve as the Board 

of Appeals.” 

 

(v) Section R113:  Section R113.4 Violation penalties is amended by 

deletion of the section in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

“Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply 

with any of the requirements thereof shall be subject to the penalties 

as prescribed in Part 16 of this Ordinance.” 

 

(w) Section R115:  Section R115 Unsafe structures and equipment is 

amended by addition to read:  “As amended in section 116 of the 

2024 International Building Code.” 

 

(x) Section R202: Section R202 Definitions is amended to read: 

 

i. “Dwelling.  Any building that contains one or two dwelling 

units used, intended, or designed to be built, used, rented, 

leased, let or hired out to be occupied, or that are occupied 

for living purposes.  Dwelling is not defined as a building 

that is used, intended, or designed to be separated as 

individually owned properties. See definition of 

townhouse.” 

 

ii. “Townhouse.  A building that contains two or more attached 

townhouse units.” 

 

(y) Section R302:  Table R302.1 (1) Exterior walls is amended by 

changing the following: 

 

i. “Walls (not fire resistance rated) Minimum Fire Separation 

Distance = 3 feet” 



18 

 

 

ii. “Projections (not fire resistance rated) Minimum Fire 

Separation Distance = 2 feet” 

 

ii. “Openings (unlimited) Minimum Fire Separation Distance = 

3 feet” 

 

iii. “Openings, deleted 25% Maximum of Wall Area/ 0 Hours/ 

3 feet” 

 

iv. “Penetrations (all) Minimum Fire Separation Distance < 3 

feet, compliance with Section R302.4 and at 3 feet or greater, 

no requirements.” 

 

(z) Section R302:  Section R302.2 Townhouses is amended for the 

purpose of this section to read:  “Townhouse shall include two (2) 

or more attached townhouse units as defined in Section R202.” 

 

(aa) Section R302:  Section R302.3 Two-family dwellings is amended 

for the purpose of this section to read:  “Two-family dwelling does 

not include buildings that are used, intended, or designed to be 

separated as individually owned properties. See definition of 

townhouse.” 

 

(bb) Section R306:  Section R306 Flood-resistant construction is 

amended by deletion of this section in its entirety and delegating 

authority to the local jurisdiction floodplain administrator. 

 

(cc) Section R309:  Section R309.1 Townhouse automatic sprinkler 

systems is amended by deletion of this section and replaced with the 

following:  “An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in 

townhouses that contain more than four townhouse units. 

Exception:  An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required 

where additions or alterations are made to existing townhouses that 

do not have an automatic sprinkler system installed.” 

 

(dd) Section R309:  Section R309.2 Automatic fire sprinkler systems 

is amended by the deletion of “shall be installed” and replaced with 

“may be installed”. 

 

(ee) Section R317:  Section R317.1 Floor surface is amended by the 

deletion of the second paragraph. 

 

(ff) Section R317:  Section R317.5 Fire sprinklers is amended by 

deletion of this section in its entirety. 

 



19 

 

(gg) Section R319:  Section R319.1 Emergency escape and rescue 

openings required first sentence is amended to read:  “Basements, 

floors above grade plane, habitable attics, the room to which a 

sleeping loft is open and every sleeping room shall have not less 

than one operable emergency escape and rescue opening.” 

 

(hh) Section R319:  Section R319.1 Emergency escape and rescue 

openings required is amended by the addition of the following 

exception: 

 

i. “5.  Storage rooms located above a garage and accessed only 

through the garage.” 

 

(ii) Section R322:  Section R322.1 Dwelling units or sleeping units is 

amended by deletion of this section in its entirety. 

 

(jj) Section R323:  Section R323 Elevators and Platform Lifts is 

amended by deletion of this section in its entirety. 

 

(kk) Section R325:  Section R325.1.2 Natural ventilation Exception 3 

is amended by deletion in its entirety and replacing with the 

following:  “Required ventilation openings shall be permitted to 

open into a thermally isolated sunroom or roofed porch, deck, or 

patio where the space has adequate openings to the outside.” 

 

(ll) Section R328:  Section R328.1 Swimming pools, spas and hot tubs 

is amended by deletion of this section in its entirety. 

 

(mm) Section R333:  Section R333 Wildfire hazard areas is amended by 

the addition of Section R333: 

 

Section R333 Requirements in Wildfire Hazard Areas. 

 

i. Section R333.1 Wildfire Hazards defined.  Areas that have 

wildfire hazard rating of medium or above (as shown on the 

Mesa County Wildfire Hazard Map). 

 

ii. Section R333.2 Roof Covering.  Roof coverings for new 

buildings or structures or additions thereto or roof covering 

utilized for re-roofing, shall be Class A or B, tested in 

accordance with ASME E108 or UL790 or an approved 

noncombustible roof covering.  For roof coverings where the 

profile allows a space between the roof covering and roof 

decking, the space at the eave ends shall be fire stopped to 

preclude entry of flames or embers or have one layer of 72-

pound (32.4 kg) mineral-surfaced, nonperforated cap sheet 



20 

 

complying with ASTM D3909 installed over the 

combustible decking. 

 

iii. Section R333.3 Roof Valleys.  Where provided, valley 

flashings shall be not less than 0.019-inch (0.44 mm) (No. 

26 galvanized sheet gage) corrosion-resistant metal installed 

over a minimum 36-inch-wide (914 mm) underlayment 

consisting of one layer of 72-pound (32.4 kg) mineral-

surfaced, nonperforated cap sheet complying with ASTM 

D3909 running the full length of the valley. 

 

iv. Section R333.4 Underfloor Enclosure. Buildings or 

structures shall have underfloor areas with habitable space 

located above enclosed to the ground with exterior walls. 

 

Exception: Complete enclosure shall not be required where 

the underside of exposed floors and exposed structural 

columns, beams and supporting walls are protected as 

required for exterior 1-hour fire-resistance-rated 

construction, fire-retardant-treated wood or heavy timber 

construction. Fire-retardant-treated wood shall be labeled for 

exterior use and meet the requirements of Section 2303.2 of 

the International Building Code. 

 

v. Section R333.5 Vents. Where provided, attic ventilation 

openings, foundation or underfloor vents, or ventilation 

openings in vertical exterior walls and vents through roofs 

shall not exceed 144 square inches (0.0929 m2) each. Such 

vents shall be covered with noncombustible corrosion-

resistant mesh with openings not to exceed 1/8 inch (3.2 

mm) or shall be designed and approved to prevent flame or 

ember penetration into the structure. 

 

vi. Section R333.6 Moved Buildings.  Any building or structure 

moved within or into any Wildfire Hazard Area shall be 

made to comply with all the requirements for new buildings 

in the Wildfire Area. 

 

vii. Section R333.7.  Replacement or repairs to buildings or 

structures in existence prior to the adoption of this code that 

are replaced or have 25 percent or more replaced in a 12-

month period shall meet the requirements of this section for 

new construction. 

 

(nn) Chapter 11 (eleven):  Chapter 11 (eleven) Energy efficiency is 

amended by the deletion of this chapter in its entirety, and replace 



21 

 

with:  “See 2024 International Energy Conservation Code as 

adopted for energy code requirements.” 

 

6.32.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the International Residential Code, 2024 Edition, and 

the Chapters of the Appendices adopted herein, together with one copy of 

the ordinance codified in this article, shall be kept on file at Town Hall.  

Copies of the IRC shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate 

price. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 7. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.36.010 – 6.36.030.  Sections 

6.36.010 – 6.36.030 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.36 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION 

CODE 

 

6.36.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The International Energy Conservation Code, 2021 Edition, 

published by the International Code Council, (hereafter “IECC” or 

“International Energy Conservation Code”) (or more current 

published energy compliance standards used in its entirety as 

approved by the Building Official)  is hereby adopted as the Energy 

Conservation Code of the Town of Collbran regulating design, 

construction, quality of materials, erection, installations, alterations, 

repair, location, relocation, replacement, additions to, use and 

maintenance of the building envelope, mechanical, lighting and 

power systems within the Jurisdiction. 

 

6.36.020 Amendments 

 

(a) Section 103:  Section R103.5 Retention of construction 

documents is hereby amended by deletion of this section in its 

entirety. 

 

(b) Section C104 & Section R104:  Section C104.2 & Section R104.2 

Schedule of permit fees are amended by the addition of the 

Ordinance, Exhibit A, Town of Collbran Building Department Fee 

Schedule.  (Copy of Exhibit A, Town of Collbran Building 

Department Fee Schedule, is on file at Town Hall.) 

 

(c) Section C104 & Section R104:  Section C104.5 & Section R104.5 

Refunds is amended by the deletion of this section in its entirety 



22 

 

and replaced with the following: “Building permit fees may be 

refunded at the rate of 85% of the building permit fee provided the 

project for which the permit was issued has not commenced and/or 

inspections have not been conducted.  No refunds will be made after 

work has commenced or after 180 days of issuance.” 

 

(d) Section C110 & Section R110: Section C110 & Section R110 

Board of appeals are amended by deletion of these sections in their 

entirety and replaced with:  “The Board of Appeals established in 

Part 13 of the Ordinance, shall serve as the Board of Appeals.” 

 

(e) Section C111 & Section R111: Section C111 & Section R111 

Duties of the code official are hereby amended by the addition of 

these sections:  “The code official is hereby authorized and directed 

to enforce the provisions of this code. The code official shall have 

the authority to render interpretations of this code and to adopt 

policies and procedures in order to clarify the application of its 

provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures shall be in 

compliance with the intent and purpose of this code. Such policies 

and procedures shall not have the effect of waiving requirements 

specifically provided for in this code.” 

 

(f) Section R402: Table R402.1.3 Insulation minimum R-values and 

fenestration requirements by component is amended by changing 

to the following values from the 2024 International Energy 

Conservation Code: 

 

5 and 

Marine 

4 

0.30i 0.55 NR 

49 

or 

30cij  

30 or 

20&5cih 

or 

13&10cih 

or 

0&20cih 

13/17 

30 or 

19&7.5ci 

or 15ci 

15ci or 

19 or 

13&5ci 

10ci, 

4 ftk 

15ci or 

19 or 

13&5ci 

 

(g) Section R402: Table R402.1.3 Insulation minimum R-values and 

fenestration requirements by component is amended by adding 

the following footnotes: 

 

i. “j.  Insulation entirely above roof deck.” 

 

ii. “k.  Slab insulation shall be installed in accordance with 

Section R402.2.9.1.” 

 

(h) Section R402:  Section R402.2.9.1 Slab-on-grade floor insulation 

installation is amended by the deletion of the second sentence and 

replaced with the following:  “Insulation located below grade shall 

be extended the distance provided in Table R402.1.3, but need not 



23 

 

exceed the footing depth in accordance with Section R403.1.4 of the 

International Residential Code.” 

 

(i) Section R408:  Section R408.2 Additional efficiency package 

options is amended by the addition of the following sentence at the 

end of the section:  “As an alternative, additional efficiency 

measures and credits complying with section R408 of the 2024 

International Energy Conservation Code, shall be deemed 

equivalent.” 

 

(j) Section R404:  Section R404.2 Interior lighting controls is 

amended by the deletion of this section in its entirety. 

 

6.36.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the International Energy Conservation Code, 2024 

edition, together with one copy of the ordinance codified in this article, shall 

be kept on file at Town Hall.  Copies of said IECC shall be available for 

sale to the public at a moderate price. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 7. Repeal and Replace Town Code Sections 6.40.010 – 6.40.030.  Sections 

6.40.010 – 6.40.030 are hereby repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.40 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 

 

6.40.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The National Electrical Code published by the National Fire 

Protection Association as amended and adopted by the State of 

Colorado Electrical Board pursuant to Title 12, Article 115 C.R.S. 

(hereafter “NEC” or “National Electrical Code”) is hereby adopted 

to regulate the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, 

installation, alteration, location, relocation, replacement, addition 

to, use and maintenance of electrical systems in the Jurisdiction. 

 

6.40.020 Amendments 

 

(a) Applicants shall pay for each electrical permit at the time of 

issuance, a fee for electrical permits and inspections as determined 

by Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building Department Fee Schedule. 

(Copy of Exhibit A Town of Collbran Building Department Fee 

Schedule, is on file at Town Hall). 

  



24 

 

6.40.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the NEC, together with one copy of the ordinance 

codified in this article, shall be kept on file at Town Hall.  Copies of the 

NEC shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 8. Enact Sections 6.44.010 – 6.44.040.  Sections 6.44.010 – 6.44.040 are 

enacted as follows: 

 

ARTICLE 6.44 COLORADO ELECTRIC AND SOLAR READY 

CODE 

 

6.44.010 Adopted by Reference 

 

(a) The Colorado Model Electric Ready and Solar Ready code language 

developed for adoption by the Energy Code Board, pursuant to 

C.R.S.§ 24-38.5-401(5), as required by HB22-1362 (the 

“CMERSRC”), is adopted as written at the time of this code 

adoption to regulate the design, construction, quality of materials, 

erection, installations, alterations, repair, location, relocation, 

replacement, additions to, use and maintenance of the building 

envelope, mechanical, lighting and power systems within the 

Jurisdiction. 

 

6.44.020 Reserved 

 

6.44.030 Copies on File and Available for Sale 

 

At least one copy of the CMERSRC, together with one copy of the 

ordinance codified in this article, shall be kept on file at Town Hall.  Copies 

of the CMERSRC shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate 

price. 

 

6.44.040 Penalties 

 

(a) Any person, firm or corporation violating any provisions of the 

CMERSRC shall be punished by a fine of not more than $1,000.00, 

or by imprisonment of not more than one year or by both such fine 

and imprisonment.  Each separate day or any portion thereof, during 

which any violation of the CMERSRC occurs or continues, shall be 

deemed to constitute a separate offense and, upon conviction 

thereof, shall be punishable as herein provided.  Any municipal 

offense under the CMERSRC shall be deemed one of strict liability. 

 



25 

 

(b) The issuing of or granting of a permit or approval of plans and 

specifications shall not be deemed or construed to be a permit for, 

or an approval of, any violation of the provisions of the CMERSRC.  

No permit presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the 

provisions of the CMERSRC shall be valid, except insofar as the 

work or use, which it authorized, is lawful. 

 

(c) The issuance of or granting of a permit or approval of plans shall not 

prevent the administrative authority from thereafter requiring the 

correction of errors in said plans and specifications, or from 

preventing construction operations being carried on thereunder 

when in violation of the CMERSRC or any other ordinance, or from 

revoking any certificate of approval when issued in error. 

 

* * * 

 

Section 9. Repeal and Reenact Section.  Sections 6.08.210 – 6.08.260 are hereby 

repealed in their entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 

Section 6.08.210 Appeals 

 

(a) A common appellate procedure and Board of Appeals to hear all appeals 

arising under the application of this Chapter, except with respect to Articles 

6.16, 6.24, and 6.40, is hereby created. 

 

(b) The Board of Appeals appointed by the Mesa County Board of County 

Commissioners shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the 

appellant with a duplicate copy to the Chief Building Official. 

 

(c) The Board of Appeals shall have jurisdiction to decide any appeals from the 

Chief Building Official if the decision of the Chief Building Official 

concerns suitability of alternate material, methods of construction or a 

reasonable interpretation of this Chapter.  The Board of Appeals shall not 

hear appeals of life safety items, administrative provisions of this Chapter 

nor shall the Board of Appeals be empowered to waive requirements of this 

Chapter.  The first order of business at any hearing of the Board of Appeals 

shall be to determine if it has jurisdiction to hear the appeal.  

 

(d) Any appeal to the Board of Appeals shall be preceded by a written appeal 

to the Chief Building Official, who shall reply in writing.  The decision of 

the Chief Building Official may be appealed to the Board of Appeals, within 

ten days from the date of the decision of the Chief Building Official.  A 

Notice of Appeal, together with a copy of the original written appeal and a 

copy of the Chief Building Official’s decision, shall be filed with the Board 

of Appeals at the time the appeal is requested. 

 



26 

 

(e) The Board of Appeals shall meet within thirty (30) days of the written 

appeal, hear evidence and argument if it deems appropriate, and shall render 

all decisions and findings in writing to the Chief Building Official with a 

duplicate copy to the appellant. 

 

Section 6.08.220 – Section 6.08.260 Reserved 

 

* * * 

 

Section 10. Conflicts and Permits Previously Issued.  All  prior resolutions or 

ordinances or parts thereof in conflict herewith to the extent of such conflicts or inconsistencies 

are hereby amended; provided, however, this ordinance shall not affect the construction of 

buildings which permits were issued prior to the effective date of this ordinance and all buildings 

now under construction pursuant to existing permits shall be constructed in conformance with the 

Building Codes applicable at the time of issuance of said permit; provided further however, that 

no construction authorized by an existing permit shall be altered without complying with the newly 

adopted Building Codes.  Nor shall the adoption of this Code prevent the prosecution of violations 

of any prior Resolution or Ordinance adopting prior Building Codes which occurred prior to the 

effective date of this Ordinance.  Where this Ordinance and the Codes adopted herein by reference 

are in conflict with other resolutions or ordinance of the Town of Collbran, Colorado, the more 

restrictive provision shall apply.  

 

Section 11. Town of Collbran Building Code Fee Schedule.  Exhibit A, the “Town of 

Collbran Building Department Fee Schedule”, as cited in this Ordinance, is attached to and adopted 

with this Ordinance and is incorporated herein by reference. 

 

Section 12. Non-assumption of Duty of Care.  The Town of Collbran, its officials, 

employees and agents thereof shall not be deemed to have assumed a duty of care where none 

otherwise existed by the performance of a service or an act of assistance for the benefit of any 

person under this ordinance or the Building Codes enacted herein.  The adoption of these Building 

Codes shall not give rise to a duty of care where none otherwise existed.  Enactment of this 

ordinance shall not constitute a waiver of sovereign immunity by the Town of Collbran, its 

officials, employees or agents. 

 

Section 13 Safety Clause.  The Board of Trustees hereby finds, determines, and 

declares that this ordinance is necessary and proper for the health, safety, and welfare of the Town 

and its residents. 

 

Section 14. Severability.  If any part, section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of 

this ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the validity of 

the remaining sections of the ordinance.  The Board of Trustees hereby declares that it would have 

passed the ordinance including each part, section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase thereof, 

irrespective of the fact that one or more part, section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase is 

declared invalid. 

 



27 

Section 15. Codification Amendments. The codifier of the Town Code, is hereby 

authorized to make such numerical and formatting changes as may be necessary to incorporate the 

provisions of this Ordinance within the Collbran Town Code. 

Section 16. Effective Date.  This Ordinance shall become effective on September 1, 

2025. 

INTRODUCED, READ, AND APPROVED ON FIRST READING THIS this 6th day of May, 

2025. 

INTRODUCED, READ, APPROVED ON SECOND READING, AND ORDERED 

PUBLISHED this 5th day of August, 2025.

ATTEST: TOWN OF COLLBRAN: 

By: By: ___________________________

Dustie Colella, Town Clerk Kendall Wilcox, Mayor 



28 

EXHIBIT A 

TOWN OF COLLBRAN BUILDING DEPARTMENT FEE SCHEDULE 

All fees related to the activities of the Town of Collbran Building Department in relation to 

public compliance with the adopted Building Codes are given in this Exhibit A.  In general, fees 

include permit fees, plan review fees and inspection fees.  All questions regarding the calculation 

of fees for any specific project should be directed to the Town of Collbran Building Department. 

Table 1A- Town of Collbran Building Department Fees 

Fee # Fee Description Fee Value 

1 

Applies to any project subject to the “Group” and 

“Type of Construction” identified by the 2003 

International Building Code.  The fee associated with 

any project type separately listed in this table will 

supersede this Permit Fee. 

Permit Fees generally include the permit and the 

inspections to support a project.  Re-inspection and 

additional plan review fees may also apply. 

Plan Review Fees in addition to the Permit Fee: 

New Commercial Construction, Addition, or 

Alteration to Commercial Building 

New One- and Two-Family residences and 

Townhouses (R-3):  Applies to new one and two 

family and townhouse projects.  The Building 

Department has the discretion to apply this fee or a 

portion thereof.  

Residential Submittal Fee: Applies to residential 

projects that hold a risk of non-issuance after staff 

intake and review, as determined by the Building 

Official. 

Third Party Plan Review:  The Building 

Department may require certain projects to have plan 

reviews completed by a third party.  Any costs 

between the applicant and the third party reviewer are 

negotiated and charged directly between the parties. 

The Building Department may assess an additional 

fee associated for the Building Department’s 

additional review. 

Table 2 

Maximum 50% of the Value 

of the Calculated Permit Fee 

as determined to be 

appropriate by the Building 

Department 

Maximum 15% of the Value 

of the Calculated Permit Fee 

as determined to be 

appropriate by the Building 

Department 

Maximum of $250 non-

refundable fee, to be applied 

to the permit fee at the time 

of issuance 

Maximum 20% of the Value 

of the Calculated Permit Fee 

as determined to be 

appropriate by the Building 

Department 



29 

Table 1B- Town of Collbran Building Department Fees (continued) 

Fees Related to Administration/Inspections 

Fee # Fee Description Fee Value 

2 
Inspections outside of normal business hours (2 hour 

minimum) 
$60.00 per hour per person 

3 
Inspections or plan review for which no fee is 

specifically indicated 
$50.00 per hour per person 

4 

Re-inspection Fee $50.00 first re-inspection 

$100.00 for addition 

re-inspection on same 

violation 

5 

Same day inspection if staff is available $100.00 in addition to 

required Re-inspection fee 

(4) 

6 

When inspections are required after Temporary 

Certificate of Occupancy expires 

Extensions before TCO expires 

$250.00 

$100.00 

7 
Administrative functions not covered in other fees (i.e. 

condemnations, oversight of unsafe conditions, etc.) 
$75. 00 per hour per person 

Project Specific Permit Fees 

Fee # Fee Description Fee Value 

8 Demolition Permit $50.00 

9 Move on Houses Permit Fee Table 2 (2) 

10 Signs Illuminated and Non Illuminated Permit Fee Table 2 (1) 

11 
Mechanical, Electrical, Plumbing, Hot Tubs, Pools & 

Spas Permit Fee 
Table 2 (1) 

12 
Manufactured Home (HUD) Permit Fee (Utilities 

Only) 
$150.00 

13 
Manufactured Home (HUD) on required Permanent 

Foundation Permit Fee 
$200.00 

14 

International Residential Code (IRC) Certified Homes 

Permit Fee on required Permanent Foundation and 

Utilities only 

IRC Certified Homes with On-Site Construction 

Inspections Verified by Town of Collbran Building 

Department 

$200.00 

Table 2 (1) 

15 Office/ Construction Trailer Permit Fee $150.00 per section 

16 

Change in Use/ Occupation Valuation Permit Fee 

Under $2,000 Valuation 

Over $2,000 Valuation 

$50.00 

Table 2 (1) 



30 

 

17 First reactivation of expired permit $50. 00 

18 Additional reactivation or release of non-compliance $50. 00 per trade included 

19 

Decks, Patio Covers, Storage Sheds & Open Carports 

Permit Fee 

Less than 400 sq. ft. in area and accessory to 

residences 

 

Plumbing, Electrical & Mechanical 

 

Over 400 sq. ft. in area: Valuation Calculated at 

$15.00 per sq. ft. 

 

 

$50. 00 

 

Table 2 (1) 

 

Table 2 

20 
Intermodal Shipping Container Shed/Storage with No 

Utilities or Attached Construction 

$50. 00 

21 
Work Commencing before Permit Issuance (at 

Building Official discretion) 

2x Permit Fee 

(1) “Total Valuation” is the actual coast of project labor and materials. 
(2) “Total Valuation” is determined by Table 3A and 3B. 

 

Table 2- Town of Collbran Permit Fee Schedule 

Total Valuation 

Permit Fee 

(All Permit Fees Rounded up to the next 

dollar) 

Up to $1200.00 $50.00 

$1200.01 to $2,000 

$50.00 for the first $1200.00 plus $2.20 for each 

additional $100.00 or fraction thereof, to and 

including $2,000 

$2,000.01 to $25,000 

$68.00 for the first $2,000.00 plus $9.90 for 

each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, 

to and including $25,000 

$25,000.01 to $50,000 

$295.70 for the first $25,000.00 plus $7.20 for 

each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, 

to and including $50,000 

$50,000.01 to $100,000 

$475.70 for the first $50,000.00 plus $5.00 for 

each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, 

to and including $100,000 

$100,000.01 to $500,000 

$725.70 for the first $100,000.00 plus $3.90 for 

each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, 

to and including $500,000 

$500,00.01 to $1,000,000 

$2,285.70 for the first $500,000.00 plus $3.30 

for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction 

thereof, to and including $1,000,000 

$1,000,000.01 And up 

$3,935.70 for the first $1,000,000.00 plus $2.20 

for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction 

thereof 



31 

 

Notes: 

1. To determine the Total Valuation for new construction or additions, select the applicable 

Square Foot Construction Cost multiplier in Table 3A and 3B- Building Valuation Data.  

The product of the identified multiplier and the area, in square feet, of the outside 

dimension of the proposed construction project is the Total Valuation. 

2. The Total Valuation for remodels is the actual labor and material cost of the project. 

 

Table 3A- Building Valuation Data 

 

Group Type of Construction 

 IA IB IIA IIB IIIA IIIB IV VA VB 

A-1 Assembly, 

Theaters, with 

stage 

160.69 153.29 149.76 143.55 133.59 132.90 138.98 123.75 119.25 

A-1 Assembly, 

Theaters, without 

stage 

148.41 141.02 137.48 131.28 121.31 120.63 126.71 111.47 106.98 

A-2 Assembly 

nightclubs 
118.34 115.03 112.14 107.94 100.98 99.751 104.00 91.98 88.94 

A-2 Assembly, 

restaurants, bars, 

banquet halls 

117.34 114.03 110.14 106.94 98.98 98.75 103.00 89.98 87.94 

A-3 Assembly, 

churches 
149.66 142.27 138.73 132.52 122.51 121.82 127.96 112.67 108.17 

A-3 Assembly, 

general, 

community halls, 

libraries, 

museums 

119.71 111.78 107.24 102.03 91.08 91.39 97.46 81.24 77.74 

A-4 Assembly, 

arenas 
117.34 114.03 110.14 106.94 98.98 98.75 103.00 89.98 87.94 

B Business 119.85 115.54 111.79 106.56 95.15 94.65 102.31 84.79 81.61 

E Educational 128.37 124.05 120.50 115.17 106.24 103.73 111.36 94.92 91.38 

F-1 Factory and 

industrial, 

moderate hazard 

74.13 70.68 66.42 64.36 55.62 56.61 61.75 47.42 45.06 

F-2 Factory and 

industrial, low 

hazard 

73.13 69.68 66.42 63.36 55.62 55.61 60.75 47.42 44.06 

H-1 High 

Hazard, 

explosives 

69.75 66.29 63.04 59.97 52.43 52.42 57.36 44.23 NP 

H234 High 

Hazard 
69.75 66.29 63.04 59.97 52.43 52.42 57.36 44.23 40.88 

H-5 HPM 119.85 115.54 111.79 106.56 95.15 94.65 102.31 84.79 81.61 



32 

I-1 Institutional,

supervised

environment

119.19 115.10 112.01 107.47 98.61 98.56 104.22 90.64 87.06 

I-2 Institutional

incapacitated
200.36 196.04 192.30 187.07 175.32 NP 182.81 164.96 NP 

I-3 Institutional,

restrained
137.99 133.67 129.93 124.70 114.47 112.98 120.44 104.12 98.94 

Table 3A- Building Valuation Data (continued) 

Group Type of Construction 

IA IB IIA IIB IIIA IIIB IV VA VB 

1-4 Institutional,

day care facilities
119.19 115.10 112.01 107.47 98.61 98.56 104.22 90.64 87.06 

M Mercantile 88.15 84.83 80.95 71.74 70.26 70.02 73.81 61.26 59.22 

R-1 Residential,

hotels
120.33 116.24 113.15 108.61 99.80 99.75 105.41 91.83 88.25 

R-2 Residential,

multi-family
100.33 96.24 93.15 88.61 79.95 79.90 85.56 71.98 68.40 

R-3 Residential,

one and two-

family

96.19 93.52 91.22 88.71 84.51 84.36 87.22 80.46 74.68 

R-4 Residential,

care/ assisted

living facilities

119.19 115.10 112.01 107.47 98.61 98.56 104.22 90.64 87.06 

S-1 Storage,

moderate hazard
68.75 65.29 61.04 58.97 50.43 51.42 56.36 42.23 39.88 

S-2 Storage, low

hazard
67.75 64.29 61.04 57.97 50.43 50.42 55.36 42.23 38.88 

U Utility, 

miscellaneous 
52.28 49.43 46.49 44.17 38.31 38.31 41.69 31.50 29.99 

Notes: 

1. Private Garages use Utility, miscellaneous Group

2. Unfinished basements (all use groups) = $15.00 per sq. ft.

3. For shell only buildings, deduct 20 percent

4. N.P. = Not Permitted

5. Complete unfinished residential basements $40.00 per sq. ft.

6. The values in this table are from the 2003 International Building Code (IBC).  This

reference to the 2003 IBC is intended to only apply to the values listed in this Table.  For

all other requirements of the Town of Collbran Building Code, including the definition of

any Group or Construction Type, the version of the IBC that applies is the one adopted

by the Building Department.





TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 
RESOLUTION NO. 12 

SERIES OF 2025 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF COLLBRAN 
COLORADO REGARDING CONTRACTING FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICE 
CONTRACTORS AND AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE TERMINATION OF 
CONTRACTS WITH KLJ ENGINEERING 

 
WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees desires to employ the best available professional service 

contractors at appropriate costs for each individual contract; and 
 

WHEREAS, the appropriate solicitation process for professional services contractors varies 
with the type of contract, the urgency of the services to be provided, and other factors particular 
to the needed work; and 

 
WHEREAS, contracts were made by previous Boards of Trustees with professional service 

contractors including but not limited to KLJ Engineering, which are not considered to be in the 
best interest of the Town of Collbran. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE TOWN OF 
COLLBRAN, COLORADO: 
 
 Section 1. The Town Administrator, or interim contractor working in that capacity, in 
consultation with the Mayor, is authorized and directed to utilize such solicitation process as is 
deemed appropriate to solicit proposals from professional services contractors as needed. 
 
 Section 2.  Following solicitation of such professional services contracts, the best proposal 
shall be presented to the Board of Trustees for approval. 
  

Section 3.  The Town Administrator or contractor retained in that interim capacity, is 
hereby authorized and directed to terminate the contracts with KLJ Engineering in accordance 
with applicable conditions in such written contracts and to cease any additional work pursuant to 
such contracts. If deemed appropriate any on-going consultation may be continued through 
completion or new contracts with KLJ Engineering may be referred to the Board of Trustees. 

 
THIS RESOLUTION was read, passed, and adopted by the Collbran Board of Trustees at 

the Regular Meeting held this 5th day of August, 2025. 
 

TOWN OF COLLBRAN, COLORADO 
 
 

By:  _______________________________ 
Kendall Wilcox, Mayor 



ATTEST: 
 

 
______________________________ 
Dustie Colella, Town Clerk 
 









To:  Collbran Board of Trustees, Town Manager, Town Clerk 

From:  Karla Distel 

Date:  July 31, 2025 

Subject:  Updates on Broadband and Auditorium Projects 

 

Pursuant to the agreement I have with the Town for project management of the fiber and auditorium 
projects, I would like to provide you with project updates. 

Collbran Middle-Mile Fiber project: 

 All of the electronic equipment (routers and switches) has been tested and placed at the Carrier Neutral 
Locations (CNLs) for the Glenwood to Grand Junction corridor fiber backbone project, including the 
Collbran CNL at Gandi Park.  The fiber between Collbran and the I-70 splice point in De Beque has been 
tested, met specifications and is “lit”.  Region 10 anticipates being able to start offering services to 
Internet Service Providers (ISPs) in mid to late August (the source of the ongoing delay is some new 
electrical work that needs to be authorized by Lumen in one of the Front Range connection points).  Eric 
Hittle, who I have copied on this email, is a Region 10 representative who can quote pricing for lease 
space in the CNL and backhaul services.  Region 10 already works with three local providers (Optimus, 
Elite and Vero) in their other locations so they should have his contact info, but if anyone else wishes to 
inquire about services, they can contact Eric as follows: 

ERIC HITTLE, CISSP 
R10 Broadband Project Manager 
(970) 507-1092 mobile 
 

In terms of our local buildout, Apeiron has completed the aerial fiber connections on the Grand Valley 
Power poles to the Job Corps, PV Clinic and PV Schools.  The downtown alley loop is complete with 
connections to the PV Fire Station, the Collbran Branch library, the Auditorium, Public Works and Town 
Hall.  Underground fiber has been placed to the bulk water plant at the fairgrounds and to the water 
treatment plant. At the Job Corps and PV Schools, fiber was brought to an agreed-upon corner of their 
respective properties, and the schools will install and maintain fiber within their campuses and contract 
with internet service providers (ISPs) for services as they choose.   

The fiber to the anchor locations is not leased to or managed by Region 10, rather the Town will lease 
those out directly to ISPs.  You will authorize use of those fibers by the ISPs via a Dark Fiber Lease 
Agreement, a draft which I provided last month, subject to changes and revisions by your staff and 
attorney.  The Board will need to decide how much to charge for use of this fiber. For comparison, Region 
10 charges a flat rate of $195 per month for use of their point-to-point fiber for in-town arrangements, and 
$230 per mile for longer runs.  Because of the DOLA funding that was part of the project, the network 
must be open access (available to all carriers) and pricing should be competitively-neutral between 
providers. 

The Collbran Middle-Mile grant expires 8/31/25.  I will work on project closeout and final reports and bill 
the grant partners for their final project shares.  I will provide you with a final project cost summary for 
youf September meeting.   

 

Collbran Auditorium: 



At the Collbran Auditorium, the metal roof/siding is installed, and they are finishing the final trim.  The new 
doors and windows are installed.  There will be an electronic keyless entry system at the northeast door 
to facilitate building rentals and event use. The mechanical and electrical contractors have completed the 
installation of the new heating system and upgrades of the electrical systems throughout the building.  
The plumbers are working on the sink and the bathrooms. In the interior of the building, it has been 
insulated and drywalled and painting is underway. The suspended ceiling and new lights are installed, 
and the ceiling fans are onsite and ready to hang. The historical wood floor in the main hall, with its’ 
unique pattern intact, is being treated with a non-toxic chemical wash, and several coats of polyurethane 
will be applied.  Chamberlin Architects continues to monitor the work to assure compliance with the 
design, and Mesa County is doing the normal building inspections as work progresses under permit 
#PM24-2466 that was issued 7/19/24.  I have attached the final review and compliance letter from 
Lindauer-Dunn, Inc. Structural Engineers dated 06/27/25. 

At this point, Asset Construction Management estimates that all work will be complete and a final 
Certificate of Occupancy (CO) for the building will be issued by mid-August 2025.  The Town should be 
able to begin scheduling events and renting out the building in September.  Prior to completion, Asset will 
provide the Town with Operation and Maintenance (O&M) Manual and/or videos to document the ongoing 
operational and maintenance requirements and will train the Public Works staff on the systems and their 
use.  For example, the floor should only be mopped with a neutral cleaner, and the Town should plan to 
have the floor professionally cleaned with new poly applied every 3-5 years, depending on use.  

Once work is complete, there are several steps required for closeout of the CDBG grant, including 
another public hearing.  I will work with your staff to schedule that.  I will work with DOLA to close out the 
CDBG grant and will request the committed funding from Mesa County.  I will provide you with a final 
project summary and cost, hopefully for your September meeting or soon thereafter. 

If you have any questions or concerns, please let me know. 

 

Respectfully, 
 
Karla Distel 
Distel Consulting, LLC 



______________________________________________________________________________________ 

802 Rood Avenue ·Grand Junction, Colorado 81501 

970.241.0900 ·970.243.2430 FAX ·www.lindauerdunn.com 

 

 
Jeffrey A. Dunn 

Principal 

Leland J. Lindauer 

Emeritus 

 
June 27, 2025 

 

Mesa County Building Department 

Dept. 5005 

P.O. Box 20,000 

Grand Junction, CO 81502-5001 

 

Subject:           Collbran Auditorium Special Inspections 

                        Building Permit No. PM24-2466 

                        102 Main Street, Collbran, Colorado 

  Lindauer Dunn, Inc. Job No. 21.075 

 

To Whom It May Concern: 

 

We have received and reviewed final summary report prepared by Geotechnical 

Engineering Group, verifying that the structural special inspections of the building have 

been completed.  The independent firm performed special inspections of the wood 

framing, structural steel, and concrete in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 17 of 

the I.B.C. 

 

The special inspectors have confirmed that the structural components of the building 

were constructed in accordance with building code requirements and per the construction 

documents and any subsequent addenda or revisions to those documents. 

 

This letter serves as our notice that the structure of the building is in compliance with the 

design documents.   If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call our office. 

 

Sincerely,                          

 

LINDAUER DUNN, INC.     

     































INSPECTION ACTIVITY REPORT

Printed 7/31/2025

Permit Number:

Address:

Applicant:

Owner:

Contractor:

Permit Status:

Issued Date:

Permit Type:

Permit Subtype:

Applied Date:

Approved Date:

Description of Work:

PM24-2810

5800 PENINSULA RD, COLLBRAN, CO 
81624

NeuComm Solutions LLC, Karen Diack

TOWN OF COLLBRAN

Finaled

Commercial

Other

5/31/2024

7/2/2024

7/10/2024

NL-NeuComm Solutions LLC

Finish Interior of Existing Shelter, Add New Tower and Add Backup Generator

Requested Date Scheduled/
Completed

Inspection Type/
Results

Inspector Inspection Comments:

7/10/2024 7/10/2024
7/11/2024

Frame - B
PARTIAL

Alan Koos Need to inspect 
exterior fire rated 
sheeting

7/11/2024 7/11/2024
7/12/2024

Insulation - B
PASS

Ryan Bradford

7/12/2024 7/12/2024
7/12/2024

Frame - B
PASS

Ryan Bradford

7/12/2024 7/12/2024
7/12/2024

Fire Wall - B
PASS

Ryan Bradford screw inspection

8/7/2024 8/7/2024
8/8/2024

Underground - E
PASS

Joseph Null

8/8/2024 8/8/2024
8/8/2024

Temporary Service - E
PASS

Joseph Null

8/21/2024 8/21/2024
8/22/2024

Final - E
PARTIAL

Joseph Null The lighting and 
receptacles will need to 
be checked once the 
power is turned on and 
the grounding to the 
tower complete before 
a final inspection can 
be completed .

1/30/2025 1/30/2025
1/30/2025

Frame - B Karen Diack

2/3/2025 2/3/2025
2/4/2025

Final - E
PASS

Jeremiah Adams

2/4/2025 2/4/2025
2/4/2025

Zoning Final
PASS

Janika Harris Per letter from Town of 
Collbran

2/5/2025 2/5/2025
2/6/2025

Final - B
PASS

Greg Barnes



______________________________________________________________________________________ 

802 Rood Avenue ·Grand Junction, Colorado 81501 

970.241.0900 ·970.243.2430 FAX ·www.lindauerdunn.com 

 

 
Jeffrey A. Dunn 

Principal 

Leland J. Lindauer 

Emeritus 

 
June 27, 2025 

 

Mesa County Building Department 

Dept. 5005 

P.O. Box 20,000 

Grand Junction, CO 81502-5001 

 

Subject:           Collbran Auditorium Special Inspections 

                        Building Permit No. PM24-2466 

                        102 Main Street, Collbran, Colorado 

  Lindauer Dunn, Inc. Job No. 21.075 

 

To Whom It May Concern: 

 

We have received and reviewed final summary report prepared by Geotechnical 

Engineering Group, verifying that the structural special inspections of the building have 

been completed.  The independent firm performed special inspections of the wood 

framing, structural steel, and concrete in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 17 of 

the I.B.C. 

 

The special inspectors have confirmed that the structural components of the building 

were constructed in accordance with building code requirements and per the construction 

documents and any subsequent addenda or revisions to those documents. 

 

This letter serves as our notice that the structure of the building is in compliance with the 

design documents.   If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call our office. 

 

Sincerely,                          

 

LINDAUER DUNN, INC.     

     























INSPECTION ACTIVITY REPORT

Printed 8/1/2025

Permit Number:

Address:

Applicant:

Owner:

Contractor:

Permit Status:

Issued Date:

Permit Type:

Permit Subtype:

Applied Date:

Approved Date:

Description of Work:

PM24-2466

102 MAIN ST, COLLBRAN, CO 81624

Derek Hamilton

TOWN OF COLLBRAN

Issued

Commercial

Business 
Remodel/Alteration

5/13/2024

6/17/2024

7/19/2024

REROOF AND REMODEL OF AUDITORIUM

Requested Date Scheduled/
Completed

Inspection Type/
Results

Inspector Inspection Comments:

5/23/2025 5/23/2025
5/27/2025

Rough-In - P
PARTIAL

Greg Barnes domestic water piping 
in floor assembly, 
talked to plumbing 
contractor about having 
all hot water lines 
insulated do to recirc 
line

5/23/2025 5/23/2025
5/27/2025

Mid-Roof - B
PASS

Greg Barnes limited inspection do to 
roof pitch

5/28/2025 5/28/2025
5/29/2025

Pipe Insulation - P
PARTIAL

Greg Barnes pipe insulation for 
piping under floor in 
south east area

6/9/2025 6/9/2025
6/10/2025

Rough-In - E
PARTIAL

Colton Radcliff West entire area in 
front of stage. Will 
need to inspect back of 
house and column 
wraps. Outlet boxes 
above T-grid ceiling 
inspected, will need 
above ceiling once T-
grid is installed.

6/10/2025 6/10/2025
6/11/2025

Mechanical Duct/ Fire 
Dampers - M
PASS

Greg Barnes

6/11/2025 6/11/2025
6/11/2025

Rough-In - P
PASS

Greg Barnes

6/11/2025 6/11/2025
6/11/2025

Gas Pipe & Test - P
PARTIAL

Greg Barnes rough in

6/11/2025 6/11/2025
6/11/2025

General Notes
Conditional Pass

Greg Barnes plans  have been 
changed two non 
bearing walls removed 
and max occupancy 
has increased.



6/16/2025 6/16/2025
6/17/2025

Rough-In - E
PARTIAL

Colton Radcliff Back of house. Demo 
needed of receptacle in 
women's bathroom 
down low, was old 
instant H2O heater. 
Column wraps will be 
final rough-in 
inspection. 

6/16/2025 6/16/2025
6/17/2025

Temporary Service - E
PASS

Colton Radcliff Ensure all grounding 
electrodes present are 
bonded together at 
final.

6/16/2025 6/16/2025
6/17/2025

Insulation - B
FAILED

Greg Barnes gaps and voids in the 
insulation where you 
can see the wall 
sheeting behind it.
also has some areas 
completely missed.
correct and recall

6/20/2025 6/20/2025
6/23/2025

Rough-In - E
PASS

Colton Radcliff Column wraps. This 
completes rough-in 
inspections. Will need 
lights in working 
condition in basement 
by final and basement 
conduit in code 
compliance.

6/23/2025 6/23/2025
6/24/2025

Insulation - B
PASS

Greg Barnes

6/26/2025 6/26/2025
6/27/2025

Frame - B
PARTIAL

Greg Barnes non structural interior 
framing. talked to 
general contractor 
about the engineer 
letters and he stated he 
will get on it right away

7/23/2025 7/23/2025
7/24/2025

Ceiling Rough-In - E
PASS

Colton Radcliff

7/23/2025 7/23/2025
7/24/2025

Rough-In - E
FAILED

Colton Radcliff Will need Vestibule and 
exterior egress 
landings at required 2 
exits to have 
emergency egress 
illumination in 
compliance with IBC 
1008.3.2. This can be 
accomplished with 
remote heads from the 
exit signs.

7/25/2025 7/25/2025
7/25/2025

Rough-In - E
PASS

Colton Radcliff



Type Scheduled Date Status Result

Rough-In - P 5/27/2025 Completed PARTIAL

Mid-Roof - B 5/27/2025 Completed PASS

Pipe Insulation - P 5/29/2025 Completed PARTIAL

Rough-In - E 6/10/2025 Completed PARTIAL

Mechanical Duct/ Fire Dampers 
- M

6/11/2025 Completed PASS

Rough-In - P 6/11/2025 Completed PASS

Gas Pipe & Test - P 6/11/2025 Completed PARTIAL

General Notes 6/11/2025 Completed Conditional Pass

Rough-In - E 6/17/2025 Completed PARTIAL

Temporary Service - E 6/17/2025 Completed PASS

Insulation - B 6/17/2025 Completed FAILED

Rough-In - E 6/23/2025 Completed PASS

Insulation - B 6/24/2025 Completed PASS

Frame - B 6/27/2025 Completed PARTIAL

Ceiling Rough-In - E 7/24/2025 Completed PASS

Rough-In - E 7/24/2025 Completed FAILED

Rough-In - E 7/25/2025 Completed PASS

Page 1 of 1

Project: PM24-2466

Address: 102 MAIN ST, COLLBRAN, CO 81624
List of Inspections:








